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Thursby, Kim

From: Kothur, Bheem

Sent: Friday, July 18, 2008 8:22 AM

To: Thursby, Kim

Subject: FW: Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.;FLO 000 207 449;71455-HO-010
Attachments: 7-15-08-Velila Permit Minor Modification Application NOD Letter.pdf

Kim,

Facility received the documents and they have acknowledge the documents on July 17, 2008.
This is FYI

Bheem

From: Phillip.Ditter@veoliaes.com [mailto:Phillip.Ditter@veoliaes.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2008 9:30 AM

To: Kothur, Bheem

Cc: Woehle, Melissa

Subject: Re: Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.;FLO 000 207 449;71455-H0-010

Bheem, can you provide any details on which items are of concern.

Phillip Ditter

EH&S Manager, Electronics Recycling
Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.
Port Washington,WI

tel. 262-243-8908
phillip.ditter@veoliaes.com
www.VeoliaES.com

To: <Phillip.ditter@veoliaes.com>

From: "Epost HWRS" <EpostHWRS@dep.state.fl.us>

Date: 07/15/2008 08:44AM

cc: "Byer, James" <James.Byer@dep.state.fl.us>, "Posner, Augusta” <Augusta.Posner@dep.state.fl.us>,
"Echevarria, Edgar" <Edgar.Echevarria@dep.state.fl.us>, "Neves, Richard"
<Richard.Neves@dep.state.fl.us>, "Woehle, Melissa" <Melissa.Woehle@dep.state.fl.us>, "Bahr, Tim"
<Tim.Bahr@dep.state.fl.us>, "Kothur, Bheem" <Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us>, "Tripp, Anthony"
<Anthony.Tripp@dep.state.fl.us=>

Subject: Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.;FLO 000 207 449;71455-HO-010

In an effort to provide a more efficient service, the Florida Department of Environmental
Protection’s Hazardous Waste Regulation Section is forwarding the attached document to you by
electronic correspondence “e-correspondence” in lieu of a hard copy through the normal postal
service.

We ask that you verify receipt of this document by sending a “reply” message to
epost_hwrs@dep.state.fl.us. If your email address has changed or you anticipate that it will change
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in the future, please advise accordingly in your reply. You may also update this information by
contacting Kim Thursby at (850) 245-8792.

The attached document is in “pdf” format and will require Adobe Reader 6 or higher to open
properly. You may download a free copy of this software at
www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep2.html.

Please note that our documents are sent virus free. However, if you use Norton Anti-virus
software, a warning may appear when attempting to open the document. Please disregard this
warning.

Your cooperation in helping us affect this process by replying as requested is greatly
appreciated. If you should have any questions about the attached document(s), please direct your
guestions to the contact person listed in the correspondence.

Tim Bahr

Environmental Administrator

Hazardous Waste Regulation
Department of Environmental Protection

E-Mail Address: epost_hwrs@dep.state.fl.us

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary Michael
W. Sole is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services provided to
you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply click on this link
to the DEP Customer Survey. Thank you in advance for completing the survey.




Charlie Crist

Florida Department of Governor
Environmental Protection Jeff Kottkamp
Bob Martinez Center .
2600 Blair Stone Road Michael W. Sole
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400 Secretary
July 15, 2008

SENT VIA E-MAIL
Phillip.ditter@veoliaes.com

Mr. Phillip Ditter, CHMM

Environmental Health and Safety Manager
Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.

342 Marpan Lane

Tallahassee, FL 32305

SUBJECT:  Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C.
EPA 1.D. Number: FLO 000 207 449
Permit Number: 71455-HO-010
Notice of Deficiency

Dear Mr. Ditter:

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection (Department) has received
your permit renewal application dated May 15, 2008 to operate a Mercury Recovery and
Mercury Reclamation Processing Facility at 342 Marpan Lane, Tallahassee, Florida.

The review of the permit Class 1 Modification application indicates that it is
incomplete. Please provide the information requested in the enclosed summary. In
preparing your response, the Department recommends that you identify each comment
followed by your response and also provide your revised pages of the application. The
revised pages are to include the new revision date.

Further action on processing your application is temporarily held in abeyance
pending receipt of your complete response. Please submit three copies (two copies to
Tallahassee and one copy to Northwest district office) of your written response within 30
days of receipt of this notice. If you cannot submit this information within 30 days, you
must formally request an extension and provide a schedule, with dates, indicating when
this information will be submitted.


mailto:Phillip.ditter@veoliaes.com

Mr. Phillip Ditter, CHMM
July 15, 2008
Page Two

Should you like to arrange a meeting or if you have any questions, please contact
Bheem Kothur at (850) 245-8781 or via e-mail: Bheem.kothur@dep.state.fl.us .

Sincerely,

Ko T —
Bheem Kothur, P.E. Il
Hazardous Waste Regulation

Enclosure

cc: Jim Byer, DEP/Pensacola, james.byer@dep.state.fl.us
Augusta Posner, DEP/Tallahassee, augusta.posner@dep.state.fl.us
Edgar Echevarria, DEP/Tallahassee, edgar.echevarria@dep.state.fl.us
Richard Neves, DEP/Tallahassee, richard.neves@dep.state.fl.us
Melissa.Woehle, DEP/Pensacola, Melissa.woehle@dep.state.fl.us
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ATTACHMENT
July 14, 2008
Veolia ES Technical Solutions, L.L.C..
Tallahassee, Florida
EPA 1.D. No. FLO0 000 207 449
Notice of Deficiency

Closure Cost Estimates: Table 9.3; Electronic Waste; Per Unit Cost:
As we discussed on July 2, 2008 through a phone conversation, the cost of the
above mentioned item appears to be too low. Please review the cost of this

item as well as the rest of the items of the closure cost estimate and resubmit it.

As for now, please remember to inflation adjust the current closure cost
estimate approximately to $179,787.00.

Site Map, Figure 4: Please provide a site map (8 %2”x11”) in electronic format

(PDF). Please send the map via e-mail, so that the map can be attached to the
permit modification. Also include hard copies of the map with your response.
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