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Russell, Merlin

From: Morgan, Steve
Sent: Tuesday, November 06, 2012 12:45 PM
To: 'Riffel, Bruce'
Cc: BOSEK, JOHN E; Tripp, Anthony; Russell, Merlin
Subject: RE: Question on Fees

Bruce: 
 
Assuming a 3-year permit to coincide with the expiration date for your RCRA permit, the solid permit fees would be as 
described – 3/5 x $2000 = $1200. As far as continuing to review drafts, I do not have an objection doing that, with the 
caveat that the next submittal of draft documents include all the information to be submitted with the application, including 
drawings and information to be submitted for the RCRA permit, that are 100% complete versions of what is proposed to 
be submitted.     
 
 
Please feel free to e-mail or call me if you have any further questions. 
  
Steven G. Morgan, Waste Management Section 
Florida Department of Environmental Protection 
Southwest District Office 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 
Temple Terrace, FL 33637-0926 
  
phone - (813) 632-7600 x385 
fax - (813) 632-7664 
e-mail - steve.morgan@dep.state.fl.us 
 
From: Russell, Merlin  
Sent: Tuesday, November 06, 2012 11:36 AM 
To: 'Riffel, Bruce'; Morgan, Steve 
Cc: BOSEK, JOHN E; Tripp, Anthony 
Subject: RE: Question on Fees 
 
Bruce, 
 
When the official request comes in.  Let’s continue to work back and forth to get everything in order so that when the 
official request comes in, we will be able to call it complete.  Steve, anything to add? 
 
merlin 
 
 

Please take a few minutes to share your comments on the service you received from the department by clicking on this 
link. DEP Customer Survey. 
From: Riffel, Bruce [mailto:riffel.bruce@cleanharbors.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, November 06, 2012 11:31 AM 
To: Morgan, Steve; Russell, Merlin 
Cc: BOSEK, JOHN E 
Subject: Question on Fees 
 
Greetings, 
 
We received your correspondence in respect to the mods we are working on for the mix tub. We have already addressed 
many of the items that were brought up in the emails.  I have a question on the permit fees.  
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When do we need to submit the fees?  
 
I know we will have a $ 1000.00 fee for Tallahassee for the part B RCRA permit mod. At our meeting Steve said we would 
need 3/5 of $ 2000.00 fee for the Solid Waste part of the permit which would need to be sent to the Tampa District 
Office.  
 
Thanks for your help on this project. 
 
 
Bruce Riffel 
Senior Compliance Manager 
Clean Harbors La Porte, LLC 
500 Independence Parkway South 
La Porte, TX 77571 
Office: 281‐884‐5519 
Cell: 832‐427‐0693 
Fax: 281‐884‐5589 
cleanharbors.com 
 
 

The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential 
and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance 
upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error, 
please contact Clean Harbors Environmental Services at 781.792.5555 and delete the material from any computer. 


