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From: Kothur, Bheem
To: Mayberry, Eric; 
Subject: FW: Copy of Legal Ad + Invoice
Date: Friday, May 03, 2013 11:16:36 AM
Attachments: Ricky_oil_invoice _05_02.pdf 


PAGE_64_nt_05_02_2013_LEGAL_NOTICE.pdf 


Hi Eric,
Please insert into OCULUS including the e-mails under Permit Intent Issue /Permit 
Application Related documents. 
 
Subject: Public Notice
Facility I.D: FLD 981 019 755
 
If you have any questions, please let me know.
Thanks.
Bheem 
 
 


From: Montinique Buquoi [mailto:Mbuquoi@synergyrecycling.org]  
Sent: Friday, May 03, 2013 10:22 AM 
To: Kothur, Bheem 
Subject: FW: Copy of Legal Ad + Invoice
 
Hi Bheem
 
Happy Friday.
Attached is a copy of the ad and the receipt. Patrick is mailing me a hard copy. 
Please let me know if there is anything more and thank you for all your assistance.
 
Have a great week end
 
Montinique
 
From: Patrick Butters [mailto:patrick.butters@miaminewtimes.com]  
Sent: Friday, May 03, 2013 9:52 AM 
To: Montinique Buquoi 
Subject: Copy of Legal Ad + Invoice
 
Hi Montinique,
I ave attached a .PDF of the Invoice and a copy of the page where we are 
running your legal notice ad please let me ow if you need anything else.
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Invoice No. 11125



MIAMI
2800 Biscayne Blvd, Suite 100, Miami FL 33137



Name Date 5/2/2013



Address Order No. 153417



City Miami FL 33166 Rep PB



Phone FOB MIAMI 



Qty Unit Price TOTAL



1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00



SubTotal  $1,200.00



Amount Paid $1,200.00



  Cash Taxes  State



  Check



  Credit Card Credit Card #3 TOTAL AMOUNT DUE  $0.00
Name



CC #



Expires



RICKY’S OILS & ENVIROMENTAL SERVICES



7209 NW 66TH STREET, 



(305)887-1653 



Don't Forget Tuesday is deadline day.



Description



Half page b/w Legal Notice to tun 05/02/2013



DTI- Account 153417 - Pain in full 



04/29/2013



INVOICE



Payment Details



Customer




















Thanks !
 
 


Patrick Butters
Senior Advertising Consultant
305-571-7519 Office 
305-571-7676 Fax 
 


Error! Filename not specified.BEST OF MIAMI® June 2013
 
MIAMI 
 
http://readerschoice.miaminewtimes.com/
 
 
BROWARD
 
http://readerschoice.browardpalmbeach.com/
 
 
CAST YOUR NOMINATIONS FOR BEST OF MIAMI®
Nominate your business and get in the running for our 2013 Readers' 
Poll. 
Nominations close May 1st 
 
Click the link  here: Best of Miami Readers Poll
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P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.





