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From: Kothur, Bheem
To: Mayberry, Eric; 
Subject: FW: Send data from MFP-07182301 05/10/2013 08:50
Date: Friday, May 10, 2013 9:22:00 AM
Attachments: DOC051013-05102013085023.pdf 


Hi Eric, 
Please insert the attached documents including the e-mails into OCULUS under 
the permit application related documents. 
 
The facility I.D. for these documents: FLR 000 119 792; 
The facility Name: CBI, Inc. Canaveral Facility. 
The Subject; Revised closure cost Estimates for the Year 2013. 
 
If you have any questions, please let me know. 
Thanks. 
Bheem 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Kothur, Bheem 
Sent: Friday, May 10, 2013 9:11 AM 
To: 'Bill Parkes'; ambrosefox@charter.net 
Cc: Eldredge, Susan F. 
Subject: FW: Send data from MFP-07182301 05/10/2013 08:50 
 
 
Hello Bill, 
 
The attached closure cost estimate for CBI, Inc. Canaveral facility is received, 
reviewed and approved for the amount of $75,020.00, for the year 2013. 
 
Please contact Susan Eldredge in Solid Waste section to comply with the FA 
Mechanism ASAP. 
The permit cannot be renewed without the FA. 
 
If you have any questions, please let me know. 
Thanks. 
Bheem   
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