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From: Wyluda, John H.

To: Russell, Merlin;

Subject: RE: Triumvirate Environmental Part B

Date: Monday, May 13, 2013 9:42:33 AM

Attachments: Form 62-730.900(4)(h) Financial Guarantee Bond signed by surety and TEI.
pdf

1. 1. Application - 730 2a [I1].pdf

Hi Merlin,

The updated files are:
(1) Form 62-730.900(4)(h) Financial Guarantee Bond Signed by surety and
TEIl.pdf
(2) 1.1.Application —7730_2a[ll].pdf
(3) Maps.pdf

From: Russell, Merlin [mailto:Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us]
Sent: Monday, May 13, 2013 9:33 AM

To: Wyluda, John H.

Subject: RE: Triumvirate Environmental Part B

John,

Please let me know specifically (by file name) which files you have revised and sent
to us for review.

merlin

Please take a few minutes to share your comments on the service you received
from the department by clicking on this link DEP Customer Survey.

From: Wyluda, John H. [mailto:jwyluda@triumvirate.com]

Sent: Friday, May 10, 2013 3:08 PM

To: Tripp, Anthony; Russell, Merlin

Cc: Barry, Richard M.; Green, James F.; Tuccillo, Eden J.; Buckley, Charles P.
Subject: Triumvirate Environmental Part B

Merlin/Tony,

The remainder of the application has been uploaded to: ftp://ftp.dep.state.fl.us/
pub/incoming/DWM under the folder Triumvirate Environmental - Orlando Part B



mailto:jwyluda@triumvirate.com
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l Print Form

DEP Form # 62-730.900({4)(h)
Fi G

Form Title

HW Facility Financlal Guarantee Bond _
Effective Date January 5, 1995
DEP Appli No.

STATE OF FLORIDA
HAZARDOUS WASTE FACILITY FINANCIAL GUARANTEE BOND

TO DEMONSTRATE FINANCIAL ASSURANCE
FOR

Closure [JPost-Closure [1Corrective Action
[Check Appropriate Box(es)]

The term “Required Action,” as used in this document means closure, post-closure care, or corrective action,
or any combination of these, which is checked above.
Date bond executed: 9-6-2011

Effective date; 9-2-2011
Principal: Triumvirate Environmental (Florida), Inc.

3701 SW 47th Avenue, Suite 109, Davie, FL 33314

Legai Name and Business Address of Owner or Operator

Type of Organization: O individual [3 Joint Venture O Partnership Corporation
Check One

State of Incorporation: Massachusetts

Surety(ies): Lexon Insurance Company
10002 Shelbyville Rd, Suite 100
Louisville, KY 40223

Name(s) and business address(es)

List for each faclilty: EPA/DEP identification Number, name, and address. Indicate “Required Action” amounts for each facliity separately.

EPA/DEP 1.D. No. Name Address
FLD 980559728 Triumvirate Environmental 10100 Rocket Blvd
(Florida), Inc. , Orange County Orlando, FL 32824

Total penal sum of bond: $156,585.00

Surety's bond number: 1024295

DEP FORM 62-730.900(4)(h) Page 10of 3







Know Alil Persons By These Presents, That we, the Principal and Surety(ies) hereto are firmly bound to the
Florida Department of Environmental Protection (hereinafter called FDEP), in the above penal sum for the
payment of which we bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and assigns jointly and
severally; provided that, where the Surety(ies) are corporations acting as co-sureties, we, the Sureties, bind
ourselves in such sum “jointly and severally" only for the purpose of allowing a joint action or actions against
any or all of us, and for all other purposes each Surety binds itself, jointly and severally with the Principal, for
the payment of such sum only as is set forth opposite the name of such Surety, but if no limit of liability is
indicated, the limit of liability shall be the full amount of the penal sum.

Whereas said Principal is required, under the Resource Conservation and Recovery Act as amended (RCRA),
to have a permit in order to own or operate each hazardous waste management facility identified above, and

Whereas said Principal is required to provide financial assurance for “Required Action” as a condition of the
permit(s), and

Whereas said Principal shall establish a standby trust fund as is required when a surety bond is used to
provide such financial assurance;

Now, Therefore, the conditions of the obligation are such that if the Principal shall faithfully, before the
beginning of final closure of each facility identified above, fund the standby trust fund in the amount(s)
identified above for the facility,

Or, if the Principal shall fund the standby trust fund in such amount(s) within 15 days after a final order to
begin closure is issued by the Secretary of the FDEP or a U.S. district court or other court of competent
jurisdiction,

Or, if the Principal shall provide alternate financial assurance, as specified in Subpart H of 40 CFR Parts 264
or 265, as adopted by reference in Section 62-730.180, Florida Administrative Code (F.A.C.), as applicable, and
obtain the FDEP Secretary's written approval of such assurance, within 90 days after the date notice of
cancellation is received by both the Principal and the FDEP Secretary from the Surety(ies), then this obligation
shall be null and void, otherwise it is to remain in full force and effect.

The Surety(ies) shall become liable on this bond obligation only when the Principal has failed to fuifill the
conditions described above. Upon notification by FDEP Secretary that the Principal has failed to perform as
guaranteed by this bond, the Surety(ieslg shall place funds in the amount guaranteed for the facility(ies) into the
standby trust fund as directed by the FDEP Secretary.

The liability of the Surety(ies) shall not be discharged by any payment or succession of payments
hereunder, unless and until such payment or payments shall amount in the aggregate to the penal sum of the
bond, but in no event shall the obligation of the Surety(ies) hereunder exceed the amount of said penal sum.

The Surety(ies) may cancel the bond by sending notice of cancellation by certified mail to the Principal and
to the Secretary of the FDEP, however, cancellation shall not occur during the 120 days beginning on the date
of receipt of the notice of cancellation by both the Principal and the FDEP Secretary, as evidenced by the return
receipts.

The Principal may terminate this bond by sending written notice to the Surety(ies), provided, however, that
no such notice shall become effective until the Surety(ies) receive(s) written authorization for termination of the
bond by the Secretary of the FDEP.

Principal and Surety(ies) hereby agree to adjust the penal sum of the bond yearly so that it guarantees a new
“Required Action” amount, provided that the penal sum does not increase by more than 20 percent in any one
year, and no decrease in the penal sum takes place without the written permission of the FDEP Secretary.

In Witness Whereof, the Principal and Surety(ies) have executed this Financial Guarantee Bond and have
affixed their seals on the date set forth above.

The persons whose signatures appear below hereby certify that they are authorized to execute this surety
bond on behalf of the Principal and Surety(ies) and that the wording of this surety bond is substantially
identical to the wording specified in 40 CFR 264.151(b), as adopted by reference in Section 62-730.180, F.A.C.,
as such regulations were constituted on the date this bond was executed except for the references to the FDEP
Secretary and the F.A.C.

DEP FORM 62-730.900(4)(h) Page 2 of 3







PRINCIPAL

CORPORATE SURETY(IES)

For each co-surety provide the following

Lexon Insurance Company

Wk I3\,

John F. McQuillan, Jr. , President &

Sole

Name and address

10002 Shelbyville Rd, Suite 100, Louisville, KY 40223

Type Name and Title Director

Corporate Seal

Bond premium: $ 4,698.00

DEP FORM 62-730.900(4)(h)

Texas

State of Incorporation

Liabiity Limic s 2+250,000.

GO [ [l

Signature

Michael W. Harjula, Attorney-In-Fact

Type Name and Titie

Corporate Seal

Page 3 0f 3







POWER OF ATTORNEY

Lx- 88865
Lexon Insurance Company

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, that LEXON INSURANCE COMPANY, a Texas Corporation, with its principal office in
Louisville, Kentucky, does hereby constitute and appoint: Robert E. Shaw, Nancy Castonguay, Heidi Rodzen, ***¥ %k doxskk

Michael A\ Harjula *****************************************************************************

its true and lawful Attorney(s)-In-Fact to make, execute, seal and deliver for, and on its behalf as surety, any and all bonds, undertakings or

other writings obligatory in nature of a bond.

This authority is made under and by the authority of a resolution which was passed by the Board of Directors of LEXON
INSURANCE COMPANY on the 1st day of July, 2003 as follows:

Resolved, that the President of the Company is hereby authorized to a

ppoint and empower any representative of the Company or

other person or persons as Attorney-In-Fact to execute on behalf of the Com|
or other writings obligatory in nature of a bond not to exceed $2,500,000.00,

might execute through its duly elected officers, and affix the seal of the Company thereto. Any said execution of such documents by an

pany any bonds, undertakings, policies, contracts of indemnity
Two-million five hundred thousand dollars, which the Company

Attorney-In-Fact shall be as binding upon the Company as if they had been dul

y executed and acknowledged by the regularly elected

officers of the Company. Any Attorney-In-Fact, so a

ppointed, may be removed for good cause and the authority so granted may be revoked

as specified in the Power of Attorney.

Resolved, that the signature of the President and the seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile on any power of attorney
granted, and the signature of the Vice President, and the seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile to any certificate of any such power
and any such power or certificate bearing such facsimile signature and seal shall be valid and binding on the Company. Any such power so
executed and sealed and certificate so executed and sealed shall, with respect to any bond of undertaking to which it is attached, continue
to be valid and binding on the Company.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, LEXON INSURANCE COMPANY has caused this instrument to be signed by its President, and its
Corporate Seal to be affixed this 21st day of September, 2009.

LEXON INSURANCE COMPANY

(T2

David E. Campbell
President

AORAN
4 y 6}23.!0!.

SN

A

INSURANCE
COMPANY

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

personally came David E. Campbell to me known, who being duly sworn, did
ANCE COMPANY, the corporation described in and which executed the above
uthority of his office under the By-laws of said corporation.

VY\/(M\C

\. Maureen K. Aye U
Notary Public

On this 21st day of September, 2009, before me,
depose and say that he is the President of LEXON INSUR
instrument; that he executed said instrument on behalf of the corporation by a

“OFFICIAL SEAL”
MAUREEN K. AYE
Notary Public, State of llinois
My Commission Expires 09/21/13

CERTIFICATE

l, the undersigned, Secretary of LEXON INSURANCE COMPANY, A Texas Insurance Company, DO HEREBY CERTIFY that the
original Power of Attorney of which the foregoing is a true and correct copy, is in full force and effect and has not been revoked and the
resolutions as set forth are now in force.

Signed and Sealed at Woodridge, Hlinois this  ~ 2nd

Day of _Septembex; 11

7 R'A.‘!y \ A

> A )

Oi TExas i3\

{3 INSURANCE {2

\% company £2 ]

Donald D. Buchanan
Secretary

.

“WARNING: Any person who knowingly and with intent to defraud any insurance company or other person, files an application for insurance or
statement of claim containing any materiaily false information, or conceals for the purpose of misieading, information concerning any fact materi-
al thereto, commits a fraudulent insurance act, which Is a crime and subjects such person to criminal and civil penalities.”

vy









| Print Form |

Revision Number 0
Date 05/09/2013
Page I-1 of

APPLICATION FOR A HAZARDOUS WASTE PERMIT
PART | - GENERAL
TO BE COMPLETED BY ALL APPLICANTS

Please Type or Print
A. General Information

1. Type of Facility in accordance with Part 270.13(a)
|:| DISPOSAL

|:| Landfill |:| Land Treatment I:' Surface Impoundment

|:| Miscellaneous Units Type of Unit

STORAGE
Containers |:| Tanks |:| Piles
|:| Surface Impoundment |:| Containment Building
|:| Miscellaneous Unit Type of Unit
TREATMENT
|:| Tanks |:| Piles I:' Surface Impoundment
I:l Incineration |:| Containment Building
I:l Boiler / Industrial Furnace Type of Unit
|:| Miscellaneous Unit Type of Unit

2. Type of application:
|:| Temporary Operation Permit (TOP)
|:| Construction Permit
Operation Permit
Construction & Operation Permit
Research, Development & Demonstration (RD&D) Permit
Postclosure Permit
Clean Closure Plan

Subpart H Remedial Action Plan

N I

Equivalency Demonstration

3. Revision Number: 0

4, Date current operation began, or is expected to begin: 01 / 01 / 1985
5. Facility Name Triumvirate Environmental (Florida) Inc.
6. EPA/DEP |.D. No. FLD 980 559 728

Page 1 of 4
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10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Revision Number 0
Date 5/9/2013
Page -2 of

Facility location or street address 10100 Rocket Boulevard Orlando, FL 32824

Facility mailing address 10100 Rocket Boulevard
street or P.O. Box

Orlando Florida 32824
city state zip
Contact person James Green Telephone (407 )859-4441

Title Vice President, Florida

Mailing address 10100 Rocket Boulevard
street or P.O. Box
Orlando FL 32824
city state zip
E-mail address jgreen@triumvirate.com
Operator’'s name James Green Telephone (407  )859-4441
Mailing address 10100 Rocket Boulevard
street or P.O. Box
Orlando FL 32824

city state zip
Facility owner's name Rocket Boulevard Properties LLC Telephone (407 )859-4441

Mailing address 10100 Rocket Boulevard
street or P.O. Box
Orlando FL 32824
city state zip

Legal structure
I:l Corporation D Non-profit corporation I:' Partnership Individual

|:| Local government |:| State government I:l Federal government |:| Other

If an individual, partnership, or business is operating under an assumed name, specify
the county and state where the name is registered.

County Not Applicable State Not Applicable

If the legal structure is a corporation, indicate the state of incorporation.

State of incorporation Florida

If the legal structure is an individual or partnership, list the owners.

Name John McQuillian

Address 200 Inner Belt Road Somerville MA 02143
Street or P.O. Box city state zip
Name
Address
Street or P.O. Box city state zip
Page 2 of 4
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Revision Number 0
Date 5/9/2013
Page [-3 of
16. Site ownership status
100
I:' Owned |:| To be purchased To be leased years
Presently leased; the expiration date of the lease is 5 A 2020
o , Rocket Boulevard Properties LLC
If leased, indicate land owner’s name
10100 Rocket Boulevard Orlando Florida 32824
Address
Street or P.O. Box city state zip
17. Name of engineer Registration No.
Address
Street or P.O. Box city state zip
Associated with
18. Is the facility located on Indian land? |:| Yes No
19. Existing or pending environmental permits (attach a separate sheet if necessary)
NAME OF PERMIT AGENCY PERMIT NUMBER DATE ISSUED EXPIRATION DATE

See Attached Shee]

Site Information

pe . O
The facility is located in range County.
Taft
The nearest community to the facility is
28 25'04" N 81 23'10"W

Latitude Longitude

Method and datum Google Earth, wgs84

e 6.123
The area of the facility site is acres.

Attach a scale drawing and photographs of the facility showing the location of all past,
present, and future treatment, storage and disposal areas. Also show the hazardous
wastes traffic pattern including estimated volume and control.

Page 3 of 4
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Revision Number 0
Date 5/9/2013
Page [-4 of

Attach a topographic map which shows all the features indicated in the instructions for
this part.

Is the facility located in a 100-year flood plain? Yes |:| No

The facility complies with the wellhead protection requirements of Rule 62-730.521,

F.A.C. Yes |:| No

Land Use Information

. .. ._Industrial (IND-4
The present zoning of the site is ( )

If a zoning change is needed, what should the new zoning be? NA

Operating Information

Is waste generated on-site? Yes |:| No

; . 562211
List the NAICS codes (5 to 6 digits)

Use the codes and units provided in the instructions to complete the following table.
Specify:

a. Each process used for treating, storing or disposing of hazardous waste
(including design capacities) at the facility, and

b. The hazardous waste(s) listed or designated in 40 CFR Part 261, including the
annual quantities, to be treated, stored, or disposed by each process at the
facility.

PROCESS CODE CAPACITY AND UNITS OF WASTE HAZARDOUS WASTE

PROCESS DESIGN HAZARDOUS ANNUAL QUANITY OF

MEASURE CODE AND UNITS OF MEASURE

See Table I.D.3

Page 4 of 4
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Permit Renewal Application. The file, application I.1. Application — 730.2a[lll], was
re-submitted from this morning with the misc. unit for consolidation being
unchecked. Additionally the financial assurance has also been re-uploaded. Two
hard copies have been sent, one to Tony Tripp and Merlin Russell and one to
Janine Kraemer. Lastly, the check, for $10,000, is being sent from our corporate
office in Somerville Massachusetts.

Best,

John H. Wyluda

Lab Services and Compliance Coordinator | Triumvirate Environmental
P: 954.583.3795 | M: 443.370.8041

Email: jwyluda@triumvirate.com

www.triumvirate.com

John H. Wyluda

Lab Services and Compliance Coordinator | Triumvirate Environmental
P: 954.583.3795 | M: 443.370.8041

Email: jwyluda@triumvirate.com

www.triumvirate.com
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