From: Kothur, Bheem

To: “nora@januaryservices.com"

Cc: Eldredge, Susan F.; Knauss, Elizabeth; Mayberry, Eric; Kothur, Bheem
Subject: FW: January Environmental Services, Inc.; The Facility 1.D: FLD 982 162 943
Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 11:12:46 AM

Attachments: UO Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form - FLDEP 2014.pdf

Hi Nora,

I have received, reviewed and approved the above attached closure cost estimate for an amount of
$112,306.00 for your facility for the year 2014.

Please contact Susan Eldredge at 850-245-8740 or e-mail: susan.eldredge@dep.state.fl.us; to
update the FA mechanism by on or before May 1, 2014.

If you have any questions with this approval, please let me know.

Sincerely,
Bheem R. Kothur, P.E., DEE
Hazardous Waste Program and Permitting

From: Nora Thorne [mailto:nora@januaryservices.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 10:41 AM

To: Solid Waste Financial Coordinator (Shared Mailbox)
Cc: Kothur, Bheem

Subject: January Environmental Services, Inc.

Please see attached, corrected form.

Thank you,

Nora Thorne

Safety & Compliance Manager
(405) 670-2030 EXT 205 Office
(866) 217-1002 E-Fax

nora@januaryservices.com
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Florida Department of Environmental Protection |25 e iereonn o

Bob Martinez Center » 2600 Blair Stone Road « Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400 Eiesind, Cost £sale Porm

Incorporaled in Rule 62-710.800{6)(b)

Used Oil Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form

pate: |4 / /3 / 2014 Date of DEP Approval; (DEP use only)

I, GENERAL INFORMATION: Latitude: 4" 3N Longitude: Z2°17° /0" 1) EPAID Number; | -0982162943
Faciity Name: SANUARY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC. oo Number: 2030717 J- Ro-0o]
Facility Address: __ 1920 late Coad (20O ujp.ﬁ'h Dacn (pﬁ:t« 33530

Mailing Address:_ Q1D . Proﬁeoc;l‘ Olahowr 4 QT‘IM\ D¢ 3 N

. - -7
Contact Person’s Name: (\'n s lanpac SIN Sc Phone Number: (4 05)(,"70-2030
E-mail CP\sAr G anuarySecy IceS. Com Fax Number. (4105 1,10 ~ (o7 H ]
Il. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check Type)
Lefter of Credit* Performance Bond* Guarantee Bond* *Indicate mechanisms that
require use of a Standby
\ insurance Certificate Financial Test Trust Fund Agreement Trust Fund Agreement

lll. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT: (check and use either box a or b, below}

Rule 62-710.800(6)(c), Florida Administrative Code, sets forth the method of annual cost estimate adjustment.
Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recalculating the maxirmum costs of closing in
current dollars. Estimates are due annually between January 1 and March 1, Select one of the methods

o&)}lﬁstima’te adjustment below.

{a} Inflation Factor Adjustment

Inflation adjustment using an inflation factor may only be made when a Department approved closing cost estimate exists
and no changes have occurred in the facility operation which would necessitate modification to the closure plan. The
inflation factor is derived from the most recent Implicit Price Deflator for Gross National Product published by the U.S.
Department of Commerce in its survey of Current Business. The inflation factor is the result of dividing the latest published

annual Deflator by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may also be obtained from the Solid Waste
Financial Coordinator at (850) 245-8732 or be found online at hitp:/fwww.dep.state.fl.us/waste/catepories/swir/

This adjustment is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: PO D
ﬁHD.MBG&.DO X .01 = $iIlEL?;oL,;.OO
Latest DEP approved Current Year Inflation Adjusted
Closing Cost Esfimat Inflation Factor Annual Closing Cost Estimate
Signature: AUJ/ Q—é Phone: (L“l 053 ("D - Q03O
T . \ \ .
Name and Title: €.\ S K/,l\’\,ud {14 =_.\_\(‘. Emait: (VS '\‘(‘ & LONWACY e Dlces o
= ¥ = = ~

If you have guestions concerning this form, please contact the Used Qil Permitting Coordinator at the address below, by
phone at (850) 245-8781, or by e-mail at; Bheem Kothur@dep.state.fl.us

Please mail this completed cost estimate to: Please e-mail or mail a copy of the cost estimate to:
Used Oil Permitting Coordinator Solid.Waste.Financial. Coordinator@dep.state.fl.us
Fiorida Department of Environmental Protection or

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4560 Solid Waste Financiat Coordinater - FDEP

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4565

Tallahassee, FL 32398-2400
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tad Sarvices,

January

IMPORTANT NOTICE: This e-mail message is intended to be received only persons entitled to
receive the confidential information it may concern. E-mail messages to clients of January Services
may contain information that is confidential and legally privileged. Please do not read, copy,
forward, or store this message unless you are an intended recipient of it. If you have received this
message in error, please forward it to the sender and delete it completely from your computer
system.



