
From: Curtis, Jeffery S
To: Russell, Merlin
Subject: RE: "Tampa Radio Public Notice"
Date: Friday, April 28, 2017 8:11:12 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Newspaper Public Notice Affadavit - Tampa Bay Times.pdf
Radio Broadcast CC Receipt.pdf
Safety-KleenSystemsInc_PRE_Inv294155-1_04302017.pdf

Hi Merlin,
 
Proof of publication in newspaper is attached.  I haven’t received the affidavit from the radio station
yet.  They told me that they only do those at the end of each month so I will get it early next week.  I
am attaching a preview of the spot and receipt for you though, and will forward the actual affidavit
next week.
 
Have a great weekend.
 
Jeff
 

From: Russell, Merlin [mailto:Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us] 
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2017 1:27 PM
To: Curtis, Jeffery S <Jeff.Curtis@safety-kleen.com>
Subject: RE: "Tampa Radio Public Notice"
 
Hi Jeff,
 
Have you received the proof of publication and radio announcement yet?
 
merlin
 

From: Curtis, Jeffery S [mailto:Jeff.Curtis@safety-kleen.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 1:01 PM
To: Russell, Merlin <Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us>
Subject: "Tampa Radio Public Notice"
 
Hi Merlin,
 
Wanted to confirm the date for you regarding the radio public notice announcement.  I was

informed this morning that they will be completing on Monday, April 24th.  Again, I’ll get you the
documentation as soon as possible following the radio announcement.
 
Thanks,  Jeff
 

Jeff Curtis  EHS Manager |  Safety-Kleen  | A Clean Harbors Company |  Boynton Beach, FL 
|  jeff.curtis@safety-kleen.com

mailto:Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:Jeff.Curtis@safety-kleen.com
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Billing Address


Clean Harbors


42 Longwater Dr.  


Norwell, MA
 20611


Credit Card Information


CREDIT CARD NUMBER: Visa ....5699


SWIPE CARD: No


STATUS: APPROVED - 059447


ORDER NUMBER: 10.174.122.186-15B9232FC90-C99F5F1-2B38FD7B


PO NUMBER: 999


WTWD-WTBN-WGUL-WLSS-SA


5211 WEST LAUREL STREET.


TAMPA, FL 3360700000, US


8136391903


Store #1001111948


04/21/17 03:27:47 PM


MO/TO Sale


Qty Unit Cost Extended Cost


1 250.00 250.00


SUBTOTAL: $250.00


TOTAL: $250.00


I AGREE TO PAY ABOVE AMOUNT ACCORDING TO CARD ISSUER.


SIGNATURE X____________________________________________________
Clean Harbors


RETURN POLICY:
Thank you for allowing us to serve you.


Transaction Receipt https://secure.linkpt.net/lpc/servlet/LPCPage


1 of 1 04/21/2017 08:28 PM
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Advertiser Product Estimate Number


Permit Notice


Flight Dates Order #


29415504/24/17 - 04/24/17


Safety-Kleen Systems Inc.


Safety-Kleen Systems Inc.


Property Sales RegionSales OfficeAccount Executive


L-Tampa LocalSteven Baltimore


Billing Calendar Billing Type


Broadcast Cash, co-op


5309 24th Ave. South
Tampa, FL  33619


Billing Address:


Caron Broadcasting, Inc.
5211 W. Laurel Street
Suite 101
Tampa, FL  33607
Main:   (813) 639-1903
Billing: (813) 349-8237 WGUL-AM


Invoice # Invoice Date Invoice Month


April 2017


Invoice Period


03/27/17 - 04/24/17


Salem Media Group, Inc.
Salem Tampa
PO BOX 932029
Atlanta, GA  31193-2029


Send Payment To:


Caron Broadcasting, Inc.


PREVIEW


Alt Order #


1of


Special Handling


Notarize with Script


Attention: Jeff Curtis


Agency Code Advertiser Code Product 1/2


Agency Ref Advertiser Ref


Deal #


Length RateAir Date Air TimeDay Ad-IDSpot # Ch Description Start/End Time TypeLine 


M-F 12:00 PM-1:00 PM 1:00 $250.00 NM04/24/17 12:54 PMM1 WGUL1


Total Spots 1


 Payment Terms:  Net Amount Due 15 Days Net Total $250.00







561.600.3076 (o)  | 561.523.4719 (c) |  561.731.1696 (f)  |  safety-kleen.com

 
Safety Starts With Me! Live it 3-6-5
 

http://safety-kleen.com/Pages/Default.aspx
http://survey.dep.state.fl.us/?refemail=Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us

