
1

Knauss, Elizabeth

From: BOSEK, JOHN E <bosek.john@cleanharbors.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2017 12:44 PM
To: Stewart.RobertG@epa.gov; garcia.javier@epa.gov
Cc: Knauss, Elizabeth; Desha, David A.
Subject: FW: EPA document request 
Attachments: BW_CCE_11-4-2011.pdf; Florida - Bartow RCRA closure inflation and renewal (Sept 2016).pdf; Florida 

- Bartow RCRA closure cert - corrected address (9-26-16).pdf; Florida - Bartow Facility Liability and 
AST Liability (Nov 2016).pdf; Bartow - EIL and closure nflation approved by DEP.pdf

Mr. Stewart – 
 
Attached please find the requested documentation that was asked for during our recent compliance inspection. Please 
let me know if I can be of any further assistance. Thank you.  
 

Safety Starts with Me: Live It 3‐6‐5 
_________________________________ 
John Bosek  

Facility General Manager 

Clean Harbors Florida LLC 

7001 Kilo Avenue 

Bartow, FL 33830 

(o) 863.519.6331 

(c) 863.559.1610 

(f) 863.519.6361 

bosek.john@cleanharbors.com  
www.cleanharbors.com 

 
 

From: Desha, David A.  
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2017 11:21 AM 
To: BOSEK, JOHN E 
Subject: RE: EPA document request  
 
John, 
 
Attached is Bartow’s closure cost estimate (CCE) from a permit renew that carried through to the latest renewal – issued 
by DEP on 10/5/2016.  The CCE has been adjusted every year for inflation costs with annual financial assurance (FA) 
renewals/updates since the CCE was calculated in 2011.  There is a pending CCE update as well as an associated FA 
increase pending with the current permit modification facility response to DEP comments due to be submitted to the 
Department by 4/21/2017.  Once the revised CCE and associated FA is approved by DEP I will ensure Mr. Stewart 
receives a copy if so desired.  That information most likely will not be final for a couple of months. 
 
Also attached is current FA issued to DEP for the facility. 
 
Best regards, 
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Safety Starts with Me: Live It 3‐6‐5 
_________________________________  
David DeSha 
Sr. Compliance Manager 
Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc. 
Mobile: 423.413.1218  
Email: desha.david@cleanharbors.com  
Web: www.cleanharbors.com 

 

_________________________________    
 

From: BOSEK, JOHN E  
Sent: Wednesday, March 22, 2017 7:30 PM 
To: Desha, David A. <David.Desha@safety‐kleen.com> 
Subject: EPA document request  
 
David – 
 
Here is what the EPA folks want as far as the Insurance policies and closure plan / cost estimate. Thanks! 
 

Safety Starts with Me: Live It 3‐6‐5 
_________________________________ 
John Bosek  

Facility General Manager 

Clean Harbors Florida LLC 

7001 Kilo Avenue 

Bartow, FL 33830 

(o) 863.519.6331 

(c) 863.559.1610 

(f) 863.519.6361 

bosek.john@cleanharbors.com  
www.cleanharbors.com 

 
 
From: noreply@cleanharbors.com [mailto:noreply@cleanharbors.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, March 22, 2017 7:11 PM 
To: BOSEK, JOHN E 
Subject: Attached Image 
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