
From: josef@us-lubes.com
To: Blandin, Norva
Subject: [FWD: ADJUSTED Surety Bond Renewal Approved!]
Date: Monday, July 17, 2017 11:31:09 AM
Attachments: Inv_5714_from_DBL_Surety_LLC_7292.pdf

-------- Original Message --------
Subject: ADJUSTED Surety Bond Renewal Approved!
From: "Bart Leek" <bleek@dblsurety.com>
Date: Wed, March 22, 2017 10:51 am
To: <josef@us-lubes.com>

DBL Surety, LLC  

Invoice   Due:04/23/2017

5714 Amount Due: $1,898.00
 

Jose: 

Please disregard the previously sent invoice as it did not include the amount of the rider
which was process last year. 
 
Your Surety Bond renewal has been approved for $1,898.00! An invoice is attached to
this email which will need to be paid prior to issuance. We accept payment via ACH
transfer, check and credit card. 

Credit Card and ACH Transfers: Please click on the "View and Pay Invoice" button
below. 

Check: Please prepare a check for the full amount of the invoice and remit it to the
address below. 

Thanks for your continued business. 

DBL Surety, LLC 
3863162547 
dblsuretybonds.com

View & Pay Invoice

 

 

 

mailto:Norva.Blandin@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:bleek@dblsurety.com
mailto:josef@us-lubes.com
http://dblsuretybonds.com/
https://connect.intuit.com/portal/app/CommerceNetwork/view/23e6475f-a858-494c-acd3-da4d71664642?locale=en_US&cta=viewinvoicenow&src=qbdt



Invoice
Date


4/23/2017
Invoice #


5714


Bill To
U.S. Lubricants, LLC
Jose Fernandez
7855 W 2nd Ct.
Hialeah, FL 33012


DBL Surety, LLC


Payment Terms


Due on receipt


Total


1500 Beville Rd
Suite 606 #311
Daytona Beach, FL 32114
Phone: (386) 316-2547
Fax:      (888) 204-8716
Web:    https://dblsuretybonds.com


https://dblsuretybonds.com
info@dblsurety.com


(386) 316-2547 - Phone
(888) 204-8716 - Fax


Description Amount
Solid Waste Closure/Post Closure - Tire Removal 1,898.00


$1,898.00
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