From:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Date:
Attachments:

Blandin, Norva

"Prokop, Daniel"

Eldredge, Susan F.; Russell, Merlin; Kothur, Bheem

RE: FDEP Compliance Evaluation Inspection- HCC Pompano Beach Inspection 6/7/18 -EPA 1D FLD984262410
Friday, August 17, 2018 12:15:00 PM
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EW 2018 Cost Estimate Approval - Solid Waste Processing Facility HeritageCrystal Clean Plant City MRF WACS 1D
No. 42485.msq

Good morning Daniel,

Any updates on the status of our noncompliance items? This facility has been out of
compliance for 72 days.

« Ten day storage limit — This was fixed during the site visit by

generating a daily waste log in order to better track containers,
generators, waste streams and date in/out. Can you provide a copy
of this new log?

Missing EPA ID of designated facilities- We are currently are reviewing
are manifest procedures and are meeting with Transflo in particular to
ensure that there are no mistakes as to where the waste was generated,
who is the transporter and the final destination for the waste. Meeting

with Transflo to take place week of 7/16/18.----- Documentation is
needed in order to determine that the facility returned to
compliance.

Weekly drum inspections, number of containers and time/date inspected
are undertaken weekly. Please provide a copy of the weekly
inspection logs for the last three years including last month. The
logs must include the appropriate elements: name, date, time, #
containers, description of the corrective actions taken.

Utilizing a Bill of lading for Hazardous Waste Shipments — It is
HCC'’s interpretation that Very Small Quantity Generators waste
shipments fall under exemption from manifesting under 40 CFR
262.14 Conditions for Exemption for a very small quantity
generator. You are completely right if all of your generators are
VSQG's. However it was noted during the inspection that HCC was
not using manifest for SQG’s facilities. Therefore, HCC must need
to revised the status of their generators and provide the appropriate
documentation and manifests. Please, explain how HCC will resolve
this issue and also, provide documentation that HCC corrected the
issues. For example, during the inspection, the inspectors noted
that multiple generators are SQG and HCC managed them and
transported their wastes with Bill of Lading. Please provide a list of


mailto:Norva.Blandin@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Daniel.Prokop@Crystal-Clean.com
mailto:Susan.F.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:Merlin.Russell@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov





FW: 2018 Cost Estimate Approval - Solid Waste Processing Facility, Heritage–Crystal Clean Plant City MRF, WACS ID No. 42485

		From

		Foley, Christine

		To

		Prokop, Daniel

		Recipients

		Daniel.Prokop@Crystal-Clean.com



Pompano closure costs



 



2018: $726,282.46



2017: $715,961.95



2016: $687,751.43



 



Chris Foley



Claims Administration Leader
847-844-5413 (desk)



224-523-1419 (cell)



847-836-6169 (direct fax)



 



Heritage Crystal Clean
2175 Point Blvd Suite 375



Elgin, Il 60123



 



G.O.A.L – Every time, all the time



 



From: Glorioso, Vinnie 
Sent: Friday, February 2, 2018 2:14 PM
To: Crandall, Scott <Scott.Crandall@Crystal-Clean.com>; Foley, Christine <Christine.Foley@Crystal-Clean.com>
Subject: FW: 2018 Cost Estimate Approval - Solid Waste Processing Facility, Heritage–Crystal Clean Plant City MRF, WACS ID No. 42485



 



Scott and Chris,



 



Here is the Plant City solid waste FDEP approval.  The spreadsheet closure cost sent yesterday is still the same.  Thanks 



 



From: Tift, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tift@dep.state.fl.us] 
Sent: Friday, February 02, 2018 1:08 PM
To: Glorioso, Vinnie <Vinnie.Glorioso@Crystal-Clean.com>
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>; Morgan, Steve <Steve.Morgan@dep.state.fl.us>; Tafuni, Steven <Steven.Tafuni@dep.state.fl.us>; Borderieux, Scott <Scott.Borderieux@dep.state.fl.us>; Madden, Melissa <Melissa.Madden@dep.state.fl.us>
Subject: 2018 Cost Estimate Approval - Solid Waste Processing Facility, Heritage–Crystal Clean Plant City MRF, WACS ID No. 42485



 



Dear Mr. Glorioso:



 



This correspondence is to acknowledge receipt of the inflation-adjusted cost estimates [DEP Form 62-701.900(28)], dated January 9, 2018 and received January 31, 2018, for closure of Heritage–Crystal Clean Plant City MRF. The cost estimates received January 31, 2018 (total for closing $76,074.57) are APPROVED for 2018. The next annual update (revised or inflation-adjusted estimates) is due no later than March 1, 2019.



 



A copy of these estimates is forwarded, via this email, to the Solid Waste Financial Coordinator at Solid.Waste.Financial.Coordinator@dep.state.fl.us. Financial assurance documents can be sent to: Solid Waste Section, FDEP, 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2407. Please work with the coordinator directly to assess the facility’s compliance with the funding mechanism requirements of Rule 62-701.630, F.A.C.



 



Further information about Solid Waste Financial Assurance can be found at the Department’s website at: https://floridadep.gov/waste/permitting-compliance-assistance/content/solid-waste-financial-assurance. 



 



Please note: Closure cost estimates related to the Plant City solid waste processing facility [DEP Form 62-701.900(28)] should be submitted to the Department’s Southwest District Solid Waste Permitting & Waste Cleanup Program for approval (SWD_Waste@dep.state.fl.us) while the cost estimates related to your used oil facilities should be submitted to the Department’s Used Oil Permitting Coordinator in our Tallahassee office.     



 



 



Best Regards,



 



Rachel Tift



Engineering Specialist II



Florida Department of Environmental Protection



Southwest District



13051 N. Telecom Parkway, Suite 101



Temple Terrace, FL 33637-0926



Rachel.Tift@floridadep.gov 



Direct line: 813.470.5755



Fax:  813.470.5996



 



Permitting Consistency Initiative: The Florida Department of Environmental Protection is committed to providing efficient, consistent and quality service to the citizens of Florida. In keeping with these objectives, we continue to identify ongoing improvements to our permitting process by standardizing and simplifying our documents.  



 



From: Glorioso, Vinnie [mailto:Vinnie.Glorioso@Crystal-Clean.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 12:07 PM
To: Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us>
Subject: RE: Heritage Crystal Clean All Facilities, Closure Cost Estimates for the Year 2018



 



Bheem,



 



I mailed the original to FDEP earlier this month and last year you sent me the approval letter.



 



Here is the PDF for your records.  If you could let me know if approved would appreciate it.  Thanks



 



Vinnie



Heritage-Crystal Clean



443-463-1598



 









Closure Cost Update to FDEP 1.9.18.pdf

<
Crvystal
Cl?éan

January 9, 2018

Used Qil Permitting Coordinator
MS 4560

2600 Blair Stone Road
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400

Re: Closure Cost Update from Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC

To used oil permitting coordinator,

Here are the completed used oil processing facility closing cost estimate forms
for the following Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC:

105 S. Alexander St, Plant City, FL 33563 Used oil and Solid waste
1280 NE 48 Street Pompano Beach, FL 33064 Used oil
5690 W. Midway Rd., Ft. Pierce, FL 34981 Used oil
2058 East 215 Street, Jacksonville FL 32206 Used oil

If you have any questions, please let me know.

Regards,
Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC

&7

Vinnie Glorioso

Regional EHS Manager

6305 E. Lombard Street
Baltimore, MD 21224
443-463-1598
vinnie.glorioso @ crystal-clean.com








Florida Department of Environmental Protection & mezreem o
Bob Martinez Center » 2600 Blair Stone Road » Tallahassee, Fiorida 32399-2400 Ciosing Cosl Estrmats Form

Effactive Oatn  4-23-13
Incorporaled In Rule 62-710.800(8)bl

Used Oil Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form

Date: 01/09/2018 Date of DEP Approval: (DEP use anly)
-82.1236 EPA ID Number: ' -2065680613

30676 HO 005

{. GENERAL INFORMATION: Latitude: 279869 Longitude:
Facility Name: Herltage-CrystaI Clean, LLC Permit Number:

Facility Address: 105 South Alexander Street, Plant City, FL 33563
6305 E. Lombard Street, Baltimore, MD 21224
Contact Person's Name: Vinnie Glorioso

E-maii: ViNNie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com

Mailing Address:

443-463-1598
410-633-1639

Phone Number:

Fax Number:
li. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check Type)
Letter of Credit” X Performance Bond” Guarantee Bond* *Indicate mechanisms that
require use of a Standby
Insurance Certificate Financial Test Trust Fund Agreement Trust Fund Agreement

{ll. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT: {check and use elther box a or b, below)

Rule 62-710.800(6)(c). Florida Administrative Code, sets forth the method of annuai cost estimate adjustment.
Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recalculating the maximum costs of closing in
current dollars. Estimates are due annually between January 1 and March 1. Select one of the methods

of cost estimate adjustment below.

@ {a} Inflation Factor Adjustment

Inflation adjustment using an inflation factor may only be made when a Department approved closing cost estimate exists
and no changes have occurred in the facility operation which would necessitate modification to the closure plan. The
inflation factor is derived from the most recent implicit Price Deflator for Gross National Product published by the U.S.
Department of Commerce in its survey of Current Business. The inflation factor is the resuit of dividing the latest published
annual Deflator by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may also be obtained from the Solid Waste
Financial Coordinator at {850} 245-8732 or be found online at htip://www.dep.state.{l.us/waste/categories/swir/

This adjustment is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: 01/09/2017
1,022,159.33 X 1.013 - 1,035,447 .40
Latest DEP approv Current Year Inflation Adjusted

Closing Cost Esti Mn Factor Annual Closing Cost Estimate
Signature: , Phone: 443-463-1598

e £ . . .
Vinnie Glorioso EHS Manager vinnie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com

Name and Title: E-mail:

if you have questions conceming this form, please contact the Used Oil Permitting Coordinator at the address below, by
phone at {850) 245-8781. or by e-mail at: Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fi.us

Please mall thls completed cost estimate to: Please e-mall or mall a copy of the cost estimate to:
Used Oil Permitting Coordinator Solid.waste Financial.Coordinator@dep.state.fi.us
Florida Department of Environmental Protection or

2600 Blalr Stone Road MS 4560 Solid Waste Financial Coordinator - FDEP
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4565

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
| of 3







PrintForm | || ResetForm |

OEP Form # 62-701 900/28), F.A.C.

Florida Department of
Environmental Protection

Bob Martinez Center

2600 Blair Slone Road linceeporassd In Ruls 82.701 830(3). FAC
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

CLOSURE COST ESTIMATING FORM FOR SOLID WASTE FACILITIES

Form Title: Closure Cosl Estimaling Form
Fo1 Solid Wasla Facililias

Efective Oale: January 6, 2010

Date of DEP Approval:
. GENERAL INFORMATION:
Facility Name:  Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC WACS ID: 4485
Permit Application or Consent Order No.:  137964-006-S0/30 Expiration Date: 05/07/2019
Facility Address: 105 S. Alexander Street, Plant City, FL 33563
Permittee or Owner/Operator:  Heritage Crystai-Ciean, LLC
Maiiing Address:  Same as above
Latitude: 28° 00' 41" Longitude: a2° 08’ 23"
Coordinate Method: Datum:
Collected by: Company/Affiliation
Solid Waste Disposal Units Included in Estimate:
Date Unit Active Life of if closed: if closed:
Began Unit From Date | if active: Date last Official
Accepting | of Initial Receipt | Remaining waste date of
Phase / Cell Acres Waste of Waste life of unit received closing |
N/A
Total disposal unit acreage included in this estimate: Closure; Long-Term Care:
Facility type: O Classl O Classiil O C&D Debris Disposal
(Check all that apply} O Other: Waste Processing Facility
Il. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check type)
O Letter of Credit® O Insurance Ceificate O Escrow Account
&5 Performance Bond* O Financial Test O Form 29 {FA Deferrai)
O Guarantee Bond* O Trust Fund Agreement

* - Indicates mechanlsms that require the use of a Standby Trust Fund Agreement

Norttwes| Olstrict Nertheay) Olstrict Cantral Oistrict Southwas) Oistrict South Disfrict Southeast District
160 Governme—t Carim 7825 Saymeadows Wey, Sts. 8200 3318 Maguire Bivd. Ste 232 13053 N Telacom Pky. 2295 Victorla Ave . Sts 364 400N Congress Ava,, St 200
Penyacota, FL 32502 5794 Jacksonville. FL 32256-7590 Ovlando. FL 32803-3767 Temple Tarrace, FL 33637  Fori Myars, FL 33901-3881 Wesl Palm Beach, FL 33401
850-595-8360 904-807-3300 407-894-7555 813-832-7600 238-232-6975 §61-881-6600







ill. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT

40 CFR Part 264 Subpart H as adopted by reference in Rule 62-701.630, Florida Administrative Code, (F.A.C.) sets forth the method of
annual cost estimate adjustment. Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recalculating the maximum costs of
closure in current dollars. Seiecl one of the methods of cost estimate ajustment below.

X (a) Inflation Factor Adjustment O (b} Recaiculated or New Cost Estimates

Inflation adjustment using an inflation factor may only be made when a Department approved closure cost estimate exists and no changes
have occurred in the facility operation which would necessitate modification to the closure plan. The inflation factor is derived from the most
recent implicit Price Deflator for Gross National Product published by the U.S. Department of Commerce in its survey of Current Business.
The inflation factor is the result of dividing the latest published annual Deflatory by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may
also be obtained from the Sclid Waste website www.dep state.fl.us/waste/categories/swir or call the Financial Coordinator at (850) 245-8706.

This adjustment is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: 01/09/2017
Latest Department Approved Current Year inflation Infiation Adjusted Closing
Closing Cost Estimate: Factor, e.g. 1.02 Cost Estimate:
$75,098.29 x 1.013 = $76.074.57

This adjustment is based on the Department approved long-term care cost estimate dated:

Latest Depariment Approved Inflation Adjusted Annuai
Annual Long-Term Care Current Year Inflation Long-Term Care Cost
Cost Estimate: Factaor, e.g. 1.02 Estimate:

x =
Number of Years of Long Term Care Remaining: x

Inflation Adjusted Long-Term Care Cost Estimate: =

ignaturg4fz X Owner/Operator O Engineer (check what applies)
/ 6305 E. Lombard Street
e Signature Address
Vinnie Glorioso EHS Manager Baitimore, MD 21224
Name & Title City. State, Zip Code
1/09/2018 vinnie.glorioso@ecrystal-clean.com
Date E-Mall Address

443-463-1598

Telephone Number

DEP FORM 62-701.800(28)
Effective January 6, 2010 2olG







Florida Department of Environmental Protection [ amseresoun e

Bob Martinez Center » 2600 Blair Stone Road » Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400 g%l—ﬁu%—%ﬂ

incomporatad In Rule 62-710,800(8)b[

Used Oil Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form

Date: 01/9/2018 Date of DEP Approval; (DEP use only)

. GENERAL INFORMATION: Latitude: 26.2893 Longitude: -80.1056 EPA ID Number: FLD984262410

Facility Name: i€Titage-Crystal Clean, LLC Permit Number: 31384 HO 004
Facility Address: 1280 NE 48th Street, Pompano Beach, FL 33064
6305 E. Lombard Street, Baltimore, MD 21224

Mailing Address:

Contact Person's Name: Vinnie Glorioso Phone Number: 443-463-1598
E-mai: ViNNie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com Fax Number:  410-633-1639
li. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check Type)
Lefter of Credit” X Performance Bond* Guarantee Bond" *Indicate mechanisms that
require use of a Standby
Insurance Certificate Financial Test Trust Fund Agreement Trust Fund Agreement

ill. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT: (check and use either box a or b, below)

Rule 62-710.800(6)(c}, Florida Administrative Code, sets forth the method of annual cost estimate adjustment.
Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recaiculating the maximum costs of closing in
current dollars. Estimates are due annually between January 1 and March 1. Select one of the methods

of cost estimate adjustment below.

E {a) inflation Factor Adjustment

inflation adjustment using an inflation factor may only be made when a Department approved closing cost estimate exists
and no changes have occurred in the facility operation which wouid necessitate modification to the closure plan. The
inflation factor is derived from the most recent implicit Price Deflator for Gross National Product published by the U.S.
Depariment of Commerce in its survey of Current Business. The inflation factor is the result of dividing the latest published
annual Deflator by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may aiso be obtained from the Solid Waste
Financial Coordinator at (850) 245-8732 or be found anline at http://www.dep.state.fl.us/waste/categories/swii/

This adjustment Is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: 01/09/2017
716,961.95 X 1.013 . 726,282.46
Latest DEP approved Current Year inflation Adjusted

Closing CostW Mn Factor Annual Closing Cost Estimate
Signature: /// Prone. 443-463-1598

Vinnie Glorioso EHS Manager vinnie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com

Name and Title; E-mail:

if you have questions conceming this form, please contact the Used Qi Permitting Coordinator at the address below, by
phone at (850) 245-8781, or by e-mail at: Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us

FPlease mall this completed cost estimate to: Please e-mall or mall a copy of the cost estimate to;
Used Oil Permitting Coordinator Solid.wWaste.Financial.Coordinator@dep.state.fl.us
Florida Department of Environmental Protection ar

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4560 Solid Waste Financial Coordinator - FDEP
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4565

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
| of 3







Florida Department of Environmental Protection |&fmeieea =

Bob Martinez Center » 2600 Blair Stone Road » Taliahasses, Florida 32399-2400 %vm—gﬂffm

Incorporated in Rule 82-710.800{8)bl

Used Oil Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form
Date: 1/9/2018 Date of DEP Approval; {DEP use anly)

\. GENERAL INFORMATION: Latitude: 2/-3744 | ongitude: 80-3800 g 1o nymber: FLO000346304
Faciity Name: €ritage-Crystal Clean, LLC Permit Number: 89606 HO 004

Facility Address: 5690 W. Midway Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981
6305 E. Lombard Street, Baltimore, MD 21224

Mailing Address:

Contact Person’s Name: Vinnie Glorioso Phone Number: 443-463-1598
E.mai: ViNNie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com Fax Number: 410-633-1639
Il. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check Type)
Letter of Credit” X Performance Bond” Guarantee Bond* *Indicate mechanisms that
require use of a Standby
Insurance Certificate Financial Test Trust Fund Agreement Trust Fund Agreement

l. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT: (check and use either box a or b, below)

Rule 62-710.800(6){(c}, Florida Administrative Code, sets forth the method of annual cost estimate adjustment.
Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recalculating the maximum costs of closing in
current dollars. Estimates are due annuaily between January 1 and March 1. Select one of the methods

of cost estimate adjustment below.

E {a} Infiation Factor Adjustment

inflation adjustment using an inflation factor may only be made when a Departiment approved closing cost estimate exists
and no changes have occurred in the facility operation which would necessitate modification to the closure plan. The
inflation factor is derived from the most recent impiicit Price Deflator for Gross National Praduct published by the U.S.
Department of Commerce in its survey of Current Business. The inflation factor is the result of dividing the latest published
annual Deflator by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may aiso be obtained from the Solid Waste
Financial Coordinator at (850} 245-8732 or be found online at http://www.dep.state.f].us/waste/categories/swir/

This adjustment is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: 1/09/2017
551,757.22 X 1.013 - 558,930.07
Latest DEP approved Current Year Inflation Adjusted

Closlng Cost Eslipna Inflation Factor Annual Closing Cost Estimate
v, onone; 443-463-1598

Signature:
Vinnie Glorioso- EHS Manager ;. vinnie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com

Name and Title:

If you have questions conceming this form, please contact the Used Qil Permitting Coordinator at the address below, by
phone at {850} 245-8781, or by e-mail at: Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.ft.us

Please mall this completed cost estimate to: Please e-mall or mall a copy of the cost estimate to:
Used Oil Permitting Coordinator Solid.Waste.Financial.Coordinator@dep.state.ft.us
Florida Department of Environmental Protection ar

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4560 Solid Waste Financial Coordinator - FDEP

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400 2600 Biair Stone Road MS 4565

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
{ of 3







Florida Department of Environmental Protection |2 meeiean

Bob Martinez Center » 2600 Blair Stone Road » Tallahasses, Florida 32399-2400 %w@—

Incorporatad in Rule 62-710.800{&8)b}|

Used Oil Processing Facility Closing Cost Estimate Form

Date: 01/09/2018 Date of DEP Approval: (DEP use only)

l. GENERAL INFORMATION: Latitude: 30.3163 Longitude: -81.7482 EPA ID Number: FLR000031393

Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC Permit Number: 203969 HO 002

Facility Name:

Facility Address: 2058 East 21st Street, Jacksonville, FL 32206
6305 E. Lombard Street, Baltimore, MD 21224
Vinnie Glorioso

Mailing Address:

443-463-1598

Contact Person's Name: Phone Number:

E-mai: ViNNie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com Fax Number:  410-633-1639
il. TYPE OF FINANCIAL ASSURANCE DOCUMENT (Check Type)
Letter of Credit* X Performance Bond* Guarantee Bond* *Indicate mechanisms that
require use of a Standby
Insurance Certificate Financial Test Trust Fund Agreement Trust Fund Agreement

. ESTIMATE ADJUSTMENT: (check and use elther box a or b, below)

Rule 62-710.800(6)(c}, Fiorida Administrative Coade, sets forth the method of annual cost estimate adjustment.
Cost estimates may be adjusted by using an inflation factor or by recalculating the maximum costs of closing in
current doilars. Estimates are due annually between January 1 and March 1. Select one of the methods

of cost estimate adjustment below.

@ {a} inflation Factor Adjustment

Inflation adjustment using an inftation factor may only be made when a Department approved closing cost estimate exists
and no changes have occurred in the facility operation which would necessitate modification to the closure plan. The
inflation factor is derived from the most recent implicit Price Deflator for Gross National Product published by the U.S.
Department of Commerce in its survey of Current Business. The inftation factor is the result of dividing the latest published
annual Deflator by the Deflator for the previous year. The inflation factor may also be obtained from the Solid Waste
Financial Coordinator at (850) 245-8732 or be found online at hitp://'www.dep. state.fl.us/'waste/categories/swit/

This adjustment is based on the Department approved closing cost estimate dated: 01/09/2017
154,172.73 X 1.013 - 156,176.97

Latest DEP approved Current Year inflation Adjusted
Closing CostW Factor Annual Closing Cost Estimate
Signature: / yv/ , Phone: 443-463-1598

Vinnie Glorioso- EHS Manager ... vinnie.glorioso@crystal-clean.com

Name and Title:

If you have questions conceming this form, please contact the Used Oil Permitting Coordinator at the address beiow, by
phone at (850) 245-8781, or by e-maii at: Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fi.us

Please mall this completed cost estimate to: Please e-mail or mall a copy of the cost estimate to:
Used Qil Permitting Coordinator Solid.Waste.Financial.Coordinator@dep.state.fl.us
Florida Department of Environmental Protection or

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4560 Solid Waste Financial Coordinator - FDEP
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4565

Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
{of3










your generator and their EPA ID. This include for used oil and
hazardous waste activities.

« Status of the Closure activities — Please provide photos and status
of the Closure activities in Pompano and when is expected to
complete the closure. Our Division located in Tallahassee must be
informed about your closure activities and updates.

Please respond to this email within 7 days.

Best regards,

Norva Blandin, MSEM
Environmental Manager

Compliance Assurance Program (CAP)
Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southeast District - West Palm Beach
3301 Gun Club Road, MSC 7210-1

West Palm Beach, FL 33406
Norva.Blandin@floridadep.gov

Office: 561.681.6728

Main: 561.681.6600

Fax: 561-681-6755

From: Prokop, Daniel <Daniel.Prokop@Crystal-Clean.com>
Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 8:53 AM

To: Blandin, Norva <Norva.Blandin@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: HCC Pompano Beach Inspection 6/7/18

Dear Ms. Blandin:

This correspondence is in response to the findings that were documented during a inspection from
the Department of Environmental Protection (“Department”), for the above referenced location
which was conducted on June 7th, 2018.

Our responses to the findings during the site visit are as follows :

e Ten day storage limit — This was fixed during the site visit by generating a daily waste
log in order to better track containers, generators, waste streams and date in/out.

e Utilizing a Bill of lading for Hazardous Waste Shipments — It is HCC's interpretation
that Very Small Quantity Generators waste shipments fall under exemption from
manifesting under 40 CFR 262.14 Conditions for Exemption for a very small quantity


mailto:Norva.Blandin@dep.state.fl.us

generator.

e Utilizing corporate EPA ID number for manifesting ILRO00130062. - HCC is registered
with US DOT as an interstate transporter based in IL. Therefore, HCC transports
materials in every state under our Elgin IL based EPA ID number, ILR 000 130 062.
Certain states, such as FL, require a State registration to conduct various activities.
HCC has completed the required notification (attached) and has indicated on each
Form Name that HCC operates as a transporter under our Federal Transporter ID
number ILR 000 130 062. At various HCC locations, we transport hazardous materials
as a 10-day transporter, and accept those materials as a transporter. The shipping
paper from generator to transporter acts as a point to point transportation
document. These materials are then transferred onto another point to point shipping
paper in which HCC is the offeror, offering the materials back into transport to the
processing facility.

e Missing EPA ID of designated facilities- We are currently are reviewing are manifest
procedures and are meeting with Transflo in particular to ensure that there are no
mistakes as to where the waste was generated, who is the transporter and the final
destination for the waste. Meeting with Transflo to take place week of 7/16/18.

e Weekly drum inspections, number of containers and time/date inspected are
undertaken weekly.

Also in following up with our site closure proceeding for the tank farm, the City of Pompano Beach
has issued our demolition permits and we have restarted work on site as of 7/9/18.

Ive included the annual closure costs in an attachment and have sent an updated contingency plan
in a previous email, | will follow up with results of Transflo meeting this week. | believe a copy of the
action plan was sent in a previous email, please let me know if | need to resend.

Daniel Prokop

Environmental Compliance Manager
Heritage-Crystal Clean

2175 Point Blvd. Suite 375

Elgin, IL 60123

(847) 844-5222 office

(224) 281-1530 cell

The information contained in this e-mail communication and any attached documentation is
intended only for the exclusive use of the designated recipient(s). If the reader or recipient of this e-
mail and any attached documentation is not the intended recipient or an employee or agent of the



intended recipient who is responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any attached
documentation is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please immediately
notify the sender by return e-mail and promptly delete the e-mail and any attached documentation.
This e-mail and any attached documentation may contain information that is privileged, confidential,
proprietary or otherwise protected by law. This notice serves as a confidentiality marking for the
purpose of any confidentiality or nondisclosure agreement. Receipt of this e-mail and the attached
documentation by anyone other than the intended recipient shall not be deemed a waiver of any
rights of confidentiality.



