
From: Troy,Randy D
To: Acosta, Kayla
Subject: Triumvirate DEP Inspection
Date: Friday, March 1, 2019 10:29:31 AM
Attachments: Correspondence with Local Authories.docx

2019 State of Florida insurance.pdf
2018 State of Florida Insurance.pdf
2017 State of Florida Insurance - Copy.pdf
2017 Closure Cost Estimate Davie.pdf
2019 Closing Cost Estimate Davie.pdf
FW Triumvirate closing cost estimate.msg

Kayla Acosta,
 
I apologize for not getting this to you sooner but our IT systems have experiencing some problems and have made access
to shares, email and other systems difficult if not impossible while our IT department get things up and running again. 
Attached you will find the proof of liability insurance that you requested and well as the closure cost estimate you
requested, and  an email verification that our most recent cost closure estimate was received and approved.  I have also
included a copy of the letter that I sent to the Davie Fire Department, Davie Police Department, Plantation General

Hospital, and the Broward General Hospital on October 6th, 2018 in which I enclosed a copy of our updated contingency
plan.  All of the letter where the same except for the addressing information. 
 
V/r
 

Randy Troy 
EHS & Transportation Compliance Specialist
Triumvirate Environmental
 P: 407-859-4441 |  M: 260-416-4981  |  F: 407-218-6703
 rtroy@triumvirate.com  |  www.triumvirate.com

mailto:rtroy@triumvirate.com
mailto:Kayla.Acosta@floridadep.gov
https://clicktime.symantec.com/3Q2veTZm8nK8M86tJyZd4qu7Vc?u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.triumvirate.com%2F
file:////c/mail%20to:%20rtroy@triumvirate.com
https://clicktime.symantec.com/3CbaAgzyvYXdewBQ36S7dBT7Vc?u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.triumvirate.com
https://clicktime.symantec.com/32GAXQUm5KwcW3qrwVz3DN37Vc?u=http%3A%2F%2Fbit.ly%2F1M8eTv5

www.triumvirate.com



Via UPS Ground



October 06, 2018

Director of Corporate Communications

Broward General Hospital

1600 S. Andrews Ave

[bookmark: _GoBack]Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316





Subject: 		Updated Contingency Plan & Emergency Procedures;

			Triumvirate Environmental (Florida), Inc.

			3701 SW 47th Avenue, Davie, FL 33314 

			EPA ID No. FLD 981 018 773





Mrs. Smith,





Please find the enclosed copy of our updated Contingency Plan. The update includes personnel changes whom are listed as the Emergency Coordinator. 



If there are any questions, please contact me at 954-583-3795.





Sincerely, 









[bookmark: _MailAutoSig]Randy Troy

Environmental, Transportation, Safety and Compliance Specialist

Triumvirate Environmental

Main: 954.583.3795 Cell: 260.416.4981 Fax: 954.583.8017

rtroy@triumvirate.com
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FW: Triumvirate closing cost estimate

		From

		Kothur, Bheem

		To

		Troy,Randy D; McQuillan, John F

		Cc

		Eldredge, Susan F.; Baker, Bryan; Blandin, Norva; Kothur, Bheem

		Recipients

		rtroy@triumvirate.com; jmcquillan@triumvirate.com; Susan.F.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us; Bryan.Baker@dep.state.fl.us; Norva.Blandin@FloridaDEP.gov; Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov



Hello Randy and all,



 



I have received the revised closure cost estimate, reviewed and approved for an amount of $492,895.00, for your facility for the Year 2019.



 



Please contact Susan Eldredge at 850-245-8740 or email: susan.eldredge@floridadep.gov;



To comply with the FA of “Guarantee Bond” for an amount of $492,895.24, by on or before May 01, 2019.



 



If you have any questions with this approval, please let me know.



 



Sincerely,



 



 



Bheem R. Kothur, P.E., DEE



Hazardous Waste Program and Permitting  



 



From: Troy,Randy D [mailto:rtroy@triumvirate.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 9, 2019 9:45 AM
To: Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: RE: Triumvirate closing cost estimate



 



The correction have been made.  Please see the attached document.  



 



V/r



 



 







Randy Troy 
EHS & Transportation Compliance Specialist
Triumvirate Environmental
 P: 407-859-4441 |  M: 260-416-4981  |  F: 407-218-6703
 rtroy@triumvirate.com  |  www.triumvirate.com



 







From: Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 09, 2019 9:31 AM
To: Troy,Randy D <rtroy@triumvirate.com>
Cc: Eldredge, Susan F. <Susan.F.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us>; Baker, Bryan <Bryan.Baker@dep.state.fl.us>; Blandin, Norva <Norva.Blandin@FloridaDEP.gov>; Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: FW: Triumvirate closing cost estimate



 



Hello Randy,



 



I have received, reviewed the above attached closure cost estimate for your facility for the Year 2019 and have the following comments:



 



1.	The approved closure cost estimate for your facility for the year 2018 was “$484,180.00” not “$482,267.77” . 



Therefore, use the approved amount of $484,180.00, in calculating the closure cost estimates for the  Year 2019. Please review, revise and resubmit.



 



If you have any questions, please let me know.



 



Sincerely,



 



 



Bheem R. Kothur, P.E., DEE



Hazardous Waste Program and Permitting 



 



From: Troy,Randy D [mailto:rtroy@triumvirate.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, January 8, 2019 9:33 AM
To: Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: Triumvirate closing cost estimate



 



Please see the attached closing cost estimate for approval.



 



V/r



 







Randy Troy 
EHS & Transportation Compliance Specialist
Triumvirate Environmental
 P: 407-859-4441 |  M: 260-416-4981  |  F: 407-218-6703
 rtroy@triumvirate.com  |  www.triumvirate.com
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www.triumvirate.com 

Via UPS Ground 
 
October 06, 2018 
Director of Corporate Communications 
Broward General Hospital 
1600 S. Andrews Ave 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316 
 
 
Subject:   Updated Contingency Plan & Emergency Procedures; 
   Triumvirate Environmental (Florida), Inc. 
   3701 SW 47th Avenue, Davie, FL 33314  
   EPA ID No. FLD 981 018 773 
 
 
Mrs. Smith, 
 
 

Please find the enclosed copy of our updated Contingency Plan. The update 
includes personnel changes whom are listed as the Emergency Coordinator.  
 
If there are any questions, please contact me at 954-583-3795. 
 
 
Sincerely,  
 
 
 
 
Randy Troy 
Environmental, Transportation, Safety and Compliance Specialist 
Triumvirate Environmental 
Main: 954.583.3795 Cell: 260.416.4981 Fax: 954.583.8017 
rtroy@triumvirate.com 
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