Knauss, Elizabeth

From: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 10:01 AM

To: Knauss, Elizabeth

Cc: Christopher Cooley; Kennedy, Shannon

Subject: RE: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323
Attachments: UES P3 Proposal to offset Consent Order Penalty SCAN Version lll.pdf
Importance: High

Beth — attached is the revised version that reflects no charge at McKay Bay for disposal. We’'ll
submit monthly our scale tickets for FDEP / Port Authority records. If this proposal is
acceptable, then we’ll initiate buying an appropriate sign. We’ll need some direction from the
Department & PTB as to how the sign should look (text, logo’s, etc.).

Thanks for your consideration.

Regards,
Ed Kinley
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Ed Kinley, President
(813)390-0659

From: Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 8:47 AM

To: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>

Subject: RE: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323

Thanks.

From: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 5:06 PM

To: Christopher Cooley <ccooley@tampaport.com>; Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>
Cc: 'Debbie Evenson' <devenson@keeptbb.org>

Subject: RE: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323

Beth — I'll revise our submittal accordingly. Will get to you in the morning.
1



Regards,
Ed Kinley

ronment |
ions, L

Ed Kinley, President
(813)390-0659

From: Christopher Cooley <ccooley@tampaport.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 5:02 PM

To: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>; Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>
Cc: 'Debbie Evenson' <devenson@keeptbb.org>

Subject: RE: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323

Hi Ed and Beth,

| just spoke with Debbie Evenson, Executive Director of Keep Tampa Bay Beautiful, and she confirmed that the City of
Tampa donated the disposal costs to the KTBB Water Goat adoption program. She confirmed that they will continue to
donate the disposal costs now that the Port is adopting the Water Goat.

Thanks you all for working with us on this. | think we will all be impressed with the amount of trash we remove from the
Bay.

Sincerely,

Christopher J. Cooley

Port Tampa Bay

Director of Environmental Affairs
T-813.905.5030

F —21 3.905.5050

“B TAMPA BAY

b% please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 3:29 PM

To: Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>

Cc: Christopher Cooley <ccooley@tampaport.com>

Subject: FW: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323




Good afternoon Beth. Is there an update from you all regarding our proposed In Kind Services?

Regards,
Ed Kinley
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Ed Kinley, President
(813)390-0659

From: Ed Kinley

Sent: Thursday, January 17, 2019 11:44 AM

To: Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>

Cc: Kennedy, Shannon <Shannon.Kennedy@FloridaDEP.gov>; Christopher Cooley <ccooley@tampaport.com>
Subject: RE: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323

Beth — please see attached. I’'m not familiar with ER Contractor rates. It’s not our fault that we
are engaged in business that pays more both to the employee & our company providing our
marine industry services. Nevertheless, | have reduced our per hour labor fee from $40.00 to
$35.00. | additionally lowered our PPE expense from $50.00 per tech to $40.00 per tech.

As to disposal, I've asked Chris Cooley from the Port how this has been handled previously. I'm
waiting on his reply. He is copied on this email. At this point, my assumption is the City will
require payment. If they’ll waive it, then I'll amend the proposal.

As to the volunteer students, the Port Authority is concerned about the long term risk of
having uninsured folks performing a regular service for them. Chris Cooley intends to provide a
formal contract / agreement to UES which will include our insurance responsibilities, and our
indemnification of them as the service provider.

Regards,
Ed Kinley
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Ed Kinley, President
(813)390-0659

From: Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 15, 2019 12:58 PM

To: Ed Kinley <ekinley@uestampa.com>

Cc: Kennedy, Shannon <Shannon.Kennedy@FloridaDEP.gov>

Subject: Additional Information Request -In-Kind Proposal - OGC Case 18-1323

Dear. Mr. Kinley:

| have reviewed your in-kind proposal to assume maintenance of the McKay Bay Nature Park “Water Goat” debris
elimination system. While this type of project is generally acceptable as an in-kind project, your proposed cost figures
appear to be excessive.

In particular, your labor cost of $40.00 per hour exceeds the contracted cost for general labor under the Department’s
contract for emergency response contractors. Please provide either a revised figure, or a justification for the higher
figure, particularly since the system is currently being maintained by volunteer college students.

In addition, please provide justification for the costs of debris disposal. Are these costs currently being borne by the City
of Tampa Solid Waste Department, Storm Water Department or other governmental agency? What is the justification
for a private entity assuming these costs?

In accordance with Paragraph I.c. of Exhibit |, please respond to these items within 30 days of receipt of this message.
The Department will review your response in accordance with the Exhibit. If you have any questions, please give me a
call.

Thanks,

Elizabeth Knauss

Environmental Consultant

Southwest District

Florida Department of Environmental Protection
813/470-5902

From: Ed Kinley [mailto:ekinley@uestampa.com]

Sent: Friday, January 04, 2019 12:21 PM

To: Knauss, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Knauss@FloridaDEP.gov>

Cc: Christopher Cooley <ccooley@tampaport.com>; Kennedy, Shannon <Shannon.Kennedy@FloridaDEP.gov>




Subject: P3 Proposal
Importance: High

Beth — sorry that this has taken a while to submit. Please see attached. We can start on this
immediately.

Regards,
Ed Kinley
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Ed Kinley, President
(813)390-0659




