
For the best experience, open this PDF portfolio in
 
Acrobat X or Adobe Reader X, or later.
 

Get Adobe Reader Now! 

http://www.adobe.com/go/reader




From: Rodriguez, Cathy C.
To: Kautz, Lance; Knauss, Elizabeth
Cc: SWD_CRA
Subject: FW: SWD CRA Transmittal 94056
Date: Friday, January 11, 2019 11:52:58 AM
Attachments: SWD CRA Transmittal 94056.pdf


OGC 18-1323 - 1.pdf
OGC 16-1280 - 2.pdf


Sorry, I meant to copy you on this.
 


From: SWD_CRA 
Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 11:49 AM
To: Revenue <Revenue@dep.state.fl.us>
Cc: SWD_CRA <SWD_CRA@dep.state.fl.us>; Melvin,Tabbatha <Tabbatha.Melvin@dep.state.fl.us>;
 Roughton, Laurie <Laurie.Roughton@dep.state.fl.us>
Subject: SWD CRA Transmittal 94056
 
Hello everyone,
 
Attached is the SWD bank transmittal and OGC payments.
 
Thank you,
 


Cathy Rodriguez
Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District
Operations Analyst I
Cathy.Rodriguez@FloridaDEP.gov
Office: 813-470-5714 (or ext. 45714)
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Transmittal Sheet Report



Remittance Number Received Date PNR/DEP DDN Receipt Num Check Num Name Remittance Amount Payment Number Payment Amount Reference Account



Transmittal Number: 94056



    Total Amount: $ 29,520.00



         Number of Items: 10



              Date Created: 11-JAN-19



                   Deposit/Verified Date: --



                        Lister: RODRIGUEZ_CC



                             Witness: RODRIGUEZ_CC



                                  Received By Accounting & Budgeting: --



                                       Collection Point: SWD



                                            DEPOSITED



1309185 26-DEC-18 988811 8183 CREIGHTON CONSTRUCTION & MANAGEMENT, LLC 600.00 1579519 600.00 549718



1309188 26-DEC-18 988814 556464 CITY OF BARTOW 320.00 1579525 320.00 549158



1310181 04-JAN-19 989440 39354 RODDA CONSTRUCTION, INC 500.00 1579526 500.00 549758



1310266 07-JAN-19 989492 89-0001422 NP LAND PARTNERS, LLC 650.00 1579619 650.00 549023



1310274 07-JAN-19 989497 20136890 CITY OF ST. PETERSBURG FLORIDA 25,000.00 1579522 25,000.00 161280



1310320 04-JAN-19 989532 002103 KIMLEY-HORN AND ASSOCIATES, INC 500.00 1579617 500.00 547783



1310327 07-JAN-19 989533 1781 CITRUS WASH & DRY LAUNDROMAT, LLC 500.00 1579628 500.00 FLA011949007



1310412 08-JAN-19 989556 97027 PJ HAYES INC DBA TANDEM CONSTRUCTION 650.00 1580134 650.00 550087



1310413 08-JAN-19 989557 97028 PJ HAYES INC DBA TANDEM CONSTRUCTION 300.00 1580223 300.00 550104



1310577 08-JAN-19 989687 9731 UNIVERSAL ENVIRONMENTAL SOLUTIONS, LLC 500.00 1579939 500.00 181323



Total : $ 29,520.00



                                            NOT DEPOSITED



1309180 26-DEC-18 988808 1213 NOVA RESOURCES, LLC 100.00



Total : $ 100.00



Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Cash Receiving Application (CRA)



Run Date :2019-1-11 11:22:35
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Desktop Deposit



Welcome Cathy Rodriguez



 Deposit Confirmation



Your deposit has been submitted. Please follow your
internal procedures for storing the original paper items,
and print this page for your records. (DTD8004)



Confirmation Number: 190111272269262
Deposit Name:
Location ID: 3700980136
Deposit Amount: $ 29,520.00
Bag Number:
Submission Date: 01/11/2019 08:19:05 AM
Effective Date: 01/11/2019
Deposit Account: 4847981701(121000248-



SOUTHWEST DISTRICT
3700980)



No of Items: 10
Created By: Cathy Rodriguez
Deposited By: Cathy Rodriguez



© Copyright 2005 - 2019 Wells Fargo. All rights reserved.
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DEP vs. Universal Environmental Solutions, LLC 
Consent Order, OGC No. 18-1323 
Page 3 of 10 



a) Effective immediately, Respondent shall comply with all Department rules 



regarding used oil management and shall comply with all applicable rules in Chapter 62-



710, Fla. Admin. Code and Title 40, C.F.R. Parts 260 and 279. 



b) Within 30 days of the effective date of this Order, Respondent shall submit an 



application for a substantial modification to the Facility' s used oil processing permit. The 



application shall accurately reflect current Facility operations. Respondent shall cease 



accepting, storing, and processing used oil if a revised used oil processing permit is not 



issued by the Department within 180 days of the effective date of this Consent Order. 



c) Respondent has already submitted an application for an alternate procedure to the 



Department to allow a mobile 20,000-gallon frac tank to be used as an above ground 



petroleum storage tank. If the alternate procedure is not granted, Respondent shall empty 



the frac tank and remove it from the Facility's secondary containment system. 



Respondent shall not use any mobile containers to store petroleum products at the facility 



for more than 180 days. 



9. Within 20 days of the effective date of this Order, Respondent shall pay the Department 



$14,586.00 in settlement of the matters addressed in this Order. This amount includes $500.00 for costs 



and expenses incurred by the Department during the investigation of this matter and the preparation and 



tracking of this Order. 



10. Respondent agrees to pay the Department stipulated penalties in the amount of$100.00 



per day for each and every day Respondent fails to timely comply with any of the requirements of 



paragraph 8 of this Order. A separate stipulated penalty shall be assessed for each violation of this 



Order, and the Department may demand stipulated penalties at any time after violations occur. 



Respondent shall pay stipulated penalties owed within 30 days of the Department's issuance of written 



demand for payment, and shall do so as further described in paragraph 11, below. Nothing in this 



Paragraph shall prevent the Department from filing suit to specifically enforce any terms of this Order. 



Any stipulated penalties assessed under this Paragraph shall be in addition to the civil penalties agreed to 



in paragraph 9 of this Order. If the Department is required to file a lawsuit to recover stipulated 



penalties under this Paragraph, the Department will not be foreclosed from seeking civil penalties for 



violations of this Order in an amount greater than the stipulated penalties due under this Paragraph. 
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DEP vs. Universal Environmental Solutions, LLC 
Consent Order, OGC No. 18-1323 
Page 4 of 10 



11. Respondent shall make all payments required by this Order by cashier's check, money 



order, or on-line payment. Cashier's check or money order shall be made payable to the "Department 



of Environmental Protection" and shall include both the OGC number assigned to this Order and the 



notation "Water Quality Assurance Trust Fund." Online payments bye-check can be made by going to 



the DEP Business Portal at: http://www.fldepportal.com/go/pay/. It will take a number of days after 



this order becomes final and effective filed with the Clerk of the Department before ability to make 



online payment is available. 



12. In lieu of making cash payment of $14,086.00 in civil penalties as set forth in paragraph 9 



above, Respondent may elect to off-set this amount by implementing an in-kind penalty project, which 



must be approved by the Department. An in-kind project must be either an environmental enhancement, 



environmental restoration, or a capital/facility improvement project. The Department may also consider 



the donation of environmentally sensitive land as an in-kind project. The value of the in-kind penalty 



project shall be one and a half times the civil penalty off-set amount, which in this case is the equivalent 



of at least $21,129.00. If Respondent chooses to implement an in-kind project, Respondent shall notify 



the Department of its election either electronically or by certified mail within 15 days of the effective 



date of this Consent Order. Notwithstanding the election to implement an in-kind project, payment 



of the remaining $500.00 in costs must be paid within 30 days of the effective date of the Consent 



Order. 



13. If Respondent elects to implement an in-kind project as provided in paragraph 12, above, 



then Respondent shall comply with all of the requirements and time frames in Exhibit I, titled In-Kind 



Projects. 



14. Except as otherwise provided, all submittals and payments required by this Order shall be 



sent to Florida Department of Environmental Protection, Southwest District, ATTN: Kelley Boatwright, 



Assistant Director, 1305 1 North Telecom Parkway, Suite 101 , Temple Terrace, Florida 33637. 



15. Respondent shall allow all authorized representatives of the Department access to the 



Facility and the Property at reasonable times for the purpose of determining compliance with the terms 



of this Order and the rules and statutes administered by the Department. 



16. Respondent shall use all reasonable efforts to obtain any necessary access to implement 



the terms of this Order. If necessary access cannot be obtained, or if obtained, is revoked by owners or 



entities controlling access to the properties to which access is necessary, Respondent shall notify the 



.. 
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DEP vs. Universal Environmental Solutions, LLC 
Consent Order, OGC No. 18-1323 
Page 8 of 10 



27. Rules referenced in this Order are available at 



https://softlive.dep.state.fl.us/ogc/ogc/content/rules. 



FOR THE RESPONDENT: 



Edward L. Kinley, Presi ent 
II l1S la~ 
DATE 



Universal Environmenta Solutions, LLC 



\."- .. \ 
DONE AND ORDERED this \S day of l'V OJ ~1o ,<2.o 18, in Hillsborough County, 



Florida. 



ary E. Yeargan, P.E. 
District Director 
Southwest District 



Filed, on this date, pursuant to Section 120.52, Fla. Stat., with the designated Department Clerk, receipt 
of which is hereby acknowledged. 



Copies furnished to: 



Lea Crandall, Agency Clerk 
Mail Station 35 



't.:.@ /.5', 6/ tJ I? 
ate 




















			OGC 18-1323 payment
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