
1

Pedigo, Leslie

From: cris januaryservices.com <cris@januaryservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2019 9:14 AM
To: Pedigo, Leslie
Cc: loren januaryservices.com; Kennedy, Shannon; SWD_CRA
Subject: Re: January Environmental Services Inc OGC File No 19-1271
Attachments: consent 7-15-19.pdf

signed and attached 

From: Pedigo, Leslie <Leslie.Pedigo@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 2:21 PM 
To: cris januaryservices.com 
Cc: loren januaryservices.com; Kennedy, Shannon; SWD_CRA 
Subject: RE: January Environmental Services Inc OGC File No 19‐1271  
  
Cris, 
  
There is nothing attached to your email.  Please resend. 
  
Thanks so much! 
  
  

 

Leslie Pedigo 
Environmental Consultant 
Compliance Assurance Program 
Florida Department of Environmental 
Protection 
Southwest District 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 
Temple Terrace, FL 33637‐0926 
(813) 470‐5870 

  

From: cris januaryservices.com <cris@januaryservices.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 2:54 PM 
To: Pedigo, Leslie <Leslie.Pedigo@FloridaDEP.gov>; loren januaryservices.com <loren@januaryservices.com> 
Cc: Kennedy, Shannon <Shannon.Kennedy@FloridaDEP.gov>; SWD_CRA <SWD_CRA@dep.state.fl.us> 
Subject: Re: January Environmental Services Inc OGC File No 19‐1271 
  

signed and attched 

From: Pedigo, Leslie <Leslie.Pedigo@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 12:37 PM 
To: cris januaryservices.com; loren januaryservices.com 
Cc: Kennedy, Shannon; SWD_CRA 
Subject: FW: January Environmental Services Inc OGC File No 19‐1271  
  
Cris and Loren, 
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Today the Department received your check in the amount of $1,500.00 for Consent Order #19‐1271.  The copy of the 
Consent Order received with the check was not signed.  Please return the signed Consent order to me as soon as 
possible.  For your convenience, a copy of the Consent Order is attached (please see the second attachment). 
  
Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns. 
  
Sincerely, 
  

 

Leslie Pedigo 
Environmental Consultant 
Compliance Assurance Program 
Florida Department of Environmental 
Protection 
Southwest District 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 
Temple Terrace, FL 33637‐0926 
(813) 470‐5870 

  

From: Simmons, Jennifer L.  
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 10:16 AM 
To: Pedigo, Leslie <Leslie.Pedigo@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Subject: January Environmental Services Inc OGC File No 19‐1271 
  
Good morning Leslie, 
  
I received the attached check from January Environmental Services for payment of penalties. Would you like 
me to send you this check or forward it to OGC here in Tallahassee? 
  
Thank you, 
Jennifer Simmons 
  

 

Jennifer L. Simmons 

Permitting & Compliance Assistance Program 
Division of Waste Management 
2600 Blair Stone Road, MS4550 
Tallahassee, FL 32399‐2400 
Jennifer.L.Simmons@dep.state.fl.us 
850.245.8706 

  

                                   Please consider the environment before printing this email. 
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