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From: Irwin, Alannah

To: Richards, Shirley

Cc: Grajeda, Carlos

Subject: RE: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt
Date: Tuesday, May 26, 2020 8:13:59 AM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Thanks Shirley!

Carlos — can you update SWIFT and the CAP Access Database to reflect that the payment has been received?

Once that is done, we can draft the case closure letter. Let me know if you need any help.

Thanks!

Alannah

From: Richards, Shirley <Shirley.Richards@FloridaDEP.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, May 26, 2020 8:12 AM

To: Irwin, Alannah <Alannah.lrwin@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: FW: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt

Alannah
This is receipt of online payment for OGC 20-0180

Shirley Richards

Operations Analyst I

Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southeast District - West Palm Beach

3301 Gun Club Road, MSC 7210-1

West Palm Beach, FL 33406

Shirley.Richards@floridadep.gov
Office: 561.681.6610

From: no-reply@dep.state.fl.us <no-reply@dep.state.fl.us>

Sent: Thursday, May 21, 2020 4:58 PM

To: avmiranda@wpcorp.net

Cc: Richards, Shirley <Shirley.Richards@FloridaDEP.gov>; OGC_ESSAOrderPayment

<OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@floridadep.gov>
Subject: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF
Environmental Protection

Bob Martinez Center
2600 Blair Stone Road
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Receipt for Payment

May 21, 2020

Ron DeSantis
Governor

Jeanette Nuiiez
Lt. Governor

Noah Valenstein
Secretary
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OGC
Number:

Receipt
Number:

Payment(s)
made by:
Address:

City, State Zip:

On behalf of:

Responsible
Party:

Address:

200180

32626

Andrea Miranda

4100 SW 47 Ave
Davie, FL 33314

WORLD PETROLEUM CORP.
ERIC MIRANDA

3650 SW 47TH AVE
DAVIE, FL 33314, US

Thank you for making your scheduled DEP Order Payment(s).

You have paid $6,890.00. This represents payment of the following scheduled Order Payment(s):

Payment Due Date: 06/12/2020 $6,890.00

Total Paid

$6,890.00

If you have any questions, please contact the Office of General Counsel at (850) 245-2268 or by e-mail

at OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@dep.state.fl.us.
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