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Receipt for Payment


November 23, 2020


OGC
Number:


201361


 


Receipt
Number:


44038


 


From: Matthew King
To: Lancellotti, Romina
Subject: FW: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt
Date: Tuesday, November 24, 2020 10:27:48 AM
Attachments: image002.png


Here’s a copy of the receipt.
 
 
Matthew S. King, CSP, SMS |Health, Safety & Environmental Manager | Tropical Shipping | Mailstop: MLK 01-12 | 501 Avenue P
| Riviera Beach, FL 33404 | Office: (561) 882-2556 |  mking@tropical.com


 
 
 
CONFIDENTIAL:  UNAUTHORIZED USE OR DISCLOSURE IS STRICTLY PROHIBITED. 
This information is intended to provide interpretative information in regard to the subject matter covered as a service to
our clients and has been answered to the best of our ability based on the information provided to us. We do not
guarantee the accuracy or completeness of any such interpretation or information, nor do we warrant that compliance
with any advice we provide will guarantee compliance with any legal or regulatory requirements.  Our statements or
opinions do not convey legal interpretation and government authorities or legal counsel should be contacted for such a
response.
 
 
 


From: no-reply@dep.state.fl.us <no-reply@dep.state.fl.us> 
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 2:58 PM
To: Matthew King <mking@tropical.com>
Cc: Shirley.Richards@dep.state.fl.us; OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@dep.state.fl.us
Subject: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt
 
Notice: This email originated from outside the TSC network.


FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF
Environmental Protection


 
Bob Martinez Center


2600 Blair Stone Road
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400


Ron DeSantis
Governor


 
Jeanette Nuñez


Lt. Governor
 


Noah Valenstein
Secretary
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Payment(s)
made by:


Matthew King


Address: 501 Ave P


City, State Zip: Riviera Beach, FL 33404


 


On behalf of:


 


Responsible
Party:


TROPICAL SHIPPING USA., LLC
DEAN BEITLER


Address: 501 AVENUE P, 
RIVIERA BEACH, FL 33404, US


Thank you for making your scheduled DEP Order Payment(s). 


You have paid $500.00. This represents payment of the following scheduled Order Payment(s):


Payment Due Date: 11/23/2020 $500.00


Total Paid $500.00


If you have any questions, please contact the Office of General Counsel at (850) 245-2268 or by e-mail
at OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@dep.state.fl.us.
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https://secure-web.cisco.com/1NpL7klCOh4LTSvqfl4Z810dsTTM9ZiycDx1-nYlIhLueTRfPCmvVAlFV0lWn7CIsoRobFKyyx0smK_FWonH1E_iv87aFKaZUOC9luP-KH2O7eQGOQHEOTmvaSieyQHqRrpPnx-OCEo-iPy4Eq0TIOxnK8eUyVQS2lmkZBd1J_Grtx8Qp_AWn__NDYHu6qeWPF41th244SbUV2DURnnISwK-LnpG5utH71cfNutsMkWbybui_setTC1U2MOSeILAWFqwDycqlRIJtHfPi6N62QwtbIR62CAz0XBGys6Tw8UoWVL8VHPdkx1reYuHjru29sAEGT0CSRpQHw-nTaNQvVQ/https%3A%2F%2Fnam02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%3Furl%3Dhttp%253A%252F%252Fsurvey.dep.state.fl.us%252F%253Frefemail%253D%26data%3D04%257C01%257Cmking%2540tropical.com%257C8e22bc75d1e84e64f34008d88fea0819%257C6858755884d04633b3a99e1a946a7f81%257C0%257C0%257C637417582613065297%257CUnknown%257CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%253D%257C1000%26sdata%3DmWvdgg065ygabHsRADRCXyRyKz8g%252F8hrsEkhuwK81gY%253D%26reserved%3D0



