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Madden, Melissa

From: Madden, Melissa
Sent: Friday, December 13, 2013 6:23 PM
To: 'Robert Sigmond'
Cc: Morgan, Steve; Pelz, Susan; Solid Waste Financial Coordinator; John Power; 'Joanne 

Chamberlain'
Subject: RE: 2013 Financial Assurance, Pasco County Class I (SW & ASH Cells), WACS No. 45799
Attachments: West Pasco inf-adj CL & LTC est approval 2013.pdf

 
 
Mr. Sigmond,  
 
Please find attached the 2013 financial assurance cost estimate approval letter for the subject solid waste 
facility.  In an effort to reduce costs and waste, our agency is moving to electronic, rather than paper, 
correspondence.  This is the only copy that you will receive, unless you make a specific request. 
 
Acrobat Reader 6.0 or greater is required to read the documents and is available for downloading 
at:  http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/ readstep.html. 
 
Please feel free to contact me with any questions or concerns. 
 
Thanks, Melissa 
 
Melissa Madden, Environmental Specialist III, Compliance Assurance Program 
 
Florida Department of Environmental Protection - Southwest District 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 
Temple Terrace, Fl  33637-0926 
melissa.madden@dep.state.fl.us 
813/470-5700 Main NEW! 
813/470-5795 Direct NEW! 
813/470-5993 Fax NEW! 
 

 
 

From: Robert Sigmond [mailto:rsigmond@pascocountyfl.net]  
Sent: Friday, December 06, 2013 7:05 AM 
To: Madden, Melissa 
Cc: Joanne Chamberlain; Morgan, Steve; Pelz, Susan; Ciaravella, Philip; Freedenberg, Henry; Tedder, Richard; Bejnar, Tor
Subject: RE: 2013 Financial Assurance, Pasco County 
 
Thank you  
 

From: Madden, Melissa [mailto:Melissa.Madden@dep.state.fl.us]  
Sent: Thursday, December 05, 2013 6:23 PM 
To: Robert Sigmond 
Cc: Joanne Chamberlain; Morgan, Steve; Pelz, Susan; Ciaravella, Philip; Freedenberg, Henry; Tedder, Richard; Bejnar, 
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Tor 
Subject: RE: 2013 Financial Assurance, Pasco County 
 
Bob, 
 
I received your voicemail message. I apologize, but I have not yet had a chance to review the cost estimates for 
Pasco County. I should be able to get something out to you next week for the West Pasco Class I. However, 
since the West Pasco Class III permit was recently renewed, I will need to check with Tallahassee permitting 
staff to determine the current approved cost estimates for this facility. I also need to check with Steve Morgan 
about the status of the East Pasco closure, and he is out of the office until next week. Pasco County may need to 
submit revised forms to reflect any changes that have occurred since Joanne’s initial submittals.  I will let you 
know as soon as possible. 
 
Please feel free to contact me with any questions or concerns. 
 
Thanks, Melissa 
 
Melissa Madden, Environmental Specialist III, Compliance Assurance Program 
 
Florida Department of Environmental Protection - Southwest District 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 
Temple Terrace, Fl  33637-0926 
melissa.madden@dep.state.fl.us 
813/470-5700 Main NEW! 
813/470-5795 Direct NEW! 
813/470-5993 Fax NEW! 
 
 

 
 

From: Joanne Chamberlain [mailto:jchamberlain@pascocountyfl.net]  
Sent: Wednesday, September 04, 2013 9:36 AM 
To: Pelz, Susan; SWD_Waste 
Subject: FW: 2013 Financial Assurance, Pasco County ‐ West Class I Solid Waste cells, WACS ID No. 45799 
 

 

 
 
Joanne Chamberlain 
Accountant II - Solid Waste, Utilities Administration and Support Services  
(727) 847-8041 X8643    FAX (727) 847-8064 
"Focused on Service, Committed to Excellence" 
Respect--Integrity--Innovation--Service Excellence--Quality--Environmental Stewardship 

 
From: Joanne Chamberlain  
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2013 11:43 AM 
To: 'SWD_Waste@dep.state.fl.us' 
Cc: 'Susan.Pelz@dep.state.fl.us'; John Power 
Subject: 2013 Financial Assurance, Pasco County - West Class I Solid Waste cells, WACS ID No. 45799 
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Please see attached Closure Cost Estimating Form. 
 
Joanne Chamberlain 
Accountant II - Solid Waste 
Pasco County Utilities 
Administration and Support Services  
Public Works/Utilities Bldg., S-204 
7536 State Street     New Port Richey, FL  34654 
(727) 847-8041 X8643     FAX (727) 847-8064 
"Focused on Service, Committed to Excellence" 
Respect--Integrity--Innovation--Service Excellence--Quality--Environmental Stewardship 

 

 

 

"Bringing Opportunities Home" 

 
The information transmitted, including attachments, is intended only for the person(s) or entity to which it is 
addressed and may contain material that is confidential, privileged and/or exempt from disclosure under 
applicable law. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance 
upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this 
in error, please contact the sender and destroy any copies of this information. Under Florida law, email 
addresses are public records. If you do not want your email address released in response to a public-records 
request, do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.  

CUSA18A7  



Florida Department of 
Environmental Protection 

Southwest District 
13051 North Telecom Parkway 

Temple Terrace, Florida 33637-0926 
Telephone:  813-470-5700 

Rick Scott 
Governor 

Herschel T. Vinyard Jr. 
Secretary

 
December 13, 2013 
 
Transmitted electronically only: 
rsigmond@pascocountyfl.net  
 
Mr. Robert J. Sigmond, Utilities Fiscal Services Director    
Pasco County Utilities Services 
7530 Little Road, S-204 
New Port Richey, Fl. 34654 
 
RE:   West Pasco Class I Landfill Ash Cells A-1, A-2, A-3 & A-4 and 

Solid Waste Cells SW-1 & SW-2 
Financial Assurance Cost Estimates 

 Site Certification No.: PA87-23  
  Pasco County, WACS No.: 45799 
 
Dear Mr. Sigmond: 
 
This letter is to acknowledge receipt of the inflation-adjusted cost estimates dated and received 
August 23, 2013, for closing and long-term care of the West Pasco Class I Landill Ash & Solid Waste 
Cells. The below cost estimates received August 23, 2013 are APPROVED for 2013. The next annual 
update (revised or inflation-adjusted estimates) is due no later than September 1, 2014. The 
approved estimates are for closing 70 existing acres (Cells A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, SW-1, & SW-2) and 70 
acres (long-term care).  
 
    Closing   Long-Term Care  
 
A-1, A-2, A-3, & A-4  $16,390,198.51  $1,063,015.86 x 30 years = $31,890,475.90 
 
SW-1 & SW-2   $2,522,010.45  $208,324.68 x 30 years = $6,249,470.40 
 
A copy of these estimates will be forwarded to FDEP Solid Waste Financial Coordinator, 2600 Blair 
Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2407.  Please work with them directly to assess the facility's 
compliance with the funding mechanism requirements of Rule 62-701.630, F.A.C. If you have any 
questions, you may contact me at (813) 470-5795. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Melissa Madden 
Compliance Assurance Section 
Southwest District 
 
mam 
cc:  John Power, Pasco County,  jpower@pascocountyfl.net 
 Solid Waste Financial Coordinator, FDEP Tallahassee 

Susan Pelz, P.E., FDEP Tampa 
Steve Morgan, FDEP Tampa  










