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Dick, Regina

From: Dick, Regina
Sent: Tuesday, December 31, 2013 1:58 PM
To: 'John@gsimRecycling.com'
Cc: Krumbholz, Bill
Subject: FW: (98386) - Approval-Closure Cost Estimate

Mr. Hoving: 
 
Per Bill’s response below, the due date range in the referenced correspondence is correct.   
 
 

Regina Dick – Admin Asst I 
Regina.Dick@dep.state.fl.us 
FDEP South District – Mon thru Fri 8:00 AM to 4:30 PM 
Direct (239) 344‐5632 – Fax (850) 412‐0590 
 

 
 

From: Krumbholz, Bill  
Sent: Tuesday, December 31, 2013 1:19 PM 
To: Dick, Regina 
Cc: Ahmadi, Abdul; McLaurin, Albert 
Subject: RE: (98386) ‐ Approval‐Closure Cost Estimate 
 
Regina, 
 
                The dates are OK. They just submitted the revised closure cost estimate a couple months early. They did the 
same thing last year and Al approved it. Bill 
 

From: Dick, Regina  
Sent: Tuesday, December 31, 2013 8:20 AM 
To: Krumbholz, Bill 
Cc: Ahmadi, Abdul 
Subject: FW: (98386) - Approval-Closure Cost Estimate 
 
Bill: 
 
Is the recipient correct about the due date range for the next submittal?  If so, should I correct it and resend the letter or 
would your reply suffice? 
 
 

Regina Dick – Admin Asst I 
Regina.Dick@dep.state.fl.us 
FDEP South District – Mon thru Fri 8:00 AM to 4:30 PM 
Direct (239) 344‐5632 – Fax (850) 412‐0590 
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From: John Hoving [mailto:john@gsimrecycling.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, December 31, 2013 7:26 AM 
To: Dick, Regina 
Cc: Tim Keene 
Subject: RE: (98386) ‐ Approval‐Closure Cost Estimate 
 
Good Morning Dick; 
Its saying the next closure cost estimate is due between 1‐1‐2014 and 3‐1‐2014 is this correct or should it be 2015? 
Thanks 
John 
___________________________ 
John Hoving 
Garden Street Iron & Metal, Inc. 
3350 Metro Pkwy. 
Ft. Myers, FL 33916 
Office: 239-337-5865 
Cell:    239-745-1916 
website: www.gsimrecycling.com 

   
 

From: Dick, Regina [mailto:Regina.Dick@dep.state.fl.us]  
Sent: Monday, December 30, 2013 2:52 PM 
To: JunkItRob@aol.com 
Cc: Tim@KeeneFL.com; Solid Waste Financial Coordinator; Krumbholz, Bill; Standiford, James; LeBlanc, Michael; 
John@gsimRecycling.com; Ahmadi, Abdul 
Subject: (98386) - Approval-Closure Cost Estimate 
 
Mr. Rob Weber: 
 
Please follow the steps below to access the link to your copy of this correspondence and then send me a “reply” 
message for confirmation of receipt.   
 

(1)    Click this hyperlink < 
http://depedms.dep.state.fl.us:80/Oculus/servlet/shell?command=getEntity&[guid=8.190237.1]&[profil
e=Fiscal] >.  Another option is to copy/paste it into the address bar of a new browser window.   

(2)    Click the button labeled PUBLIC OCULUS LOGIN.   
(3)    Click the icon under the Preview column.  Another option is to click the Select button to use the prompt 

to either Open or Save the document. 
NOTE:  If you choose the latter method, complete it within 60 seconds; otherwise, a harmless error will 

simply necessitate another attempt. 
 
Bill Krumbholz (239‐344‐5657) and Dr. Abdul Ahmadi, P.E. (239‐344‐5614) can answer questions regarding document 
content.   
 
Thanks! 
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Regina Dick – Admin Asst I 
Regina.Dick@dep.state.fl.us 
FDEP South District – Mon thru Fri 8:00 AM to 4:30 PM 
Direct (239) 344‐5632 – Fax (850) 412‐0590 
 

 
 

Please take a few minutes to share your comments on the service you received from the Department by clicking 
on this link. DEP Customer Survey.  


