From: tim.keenefl@gmail.com on behalf of Tim Keene

To: Moon, Nolin

Cc: robert weber

Subject: Re: Waste Tire Permit Renewal, WACS ID 00098386 - Garden Street
Date: Friday, December 12, 2014 4:06:02 PM

Attachments: GREEN WASTE -WHERRY.pdf

Hi Nolin,

Attached is the updated agreement between Garden Street and Wherry Trucking. This
replaces the previous agreement attached to my closing cost estimate. My signed estimate
does not change.

Please let me know if there is anything else additionally you need.

Thank you.

Tim Keene.

On Wed, Nov 26, 2014 at 7:41 AM, Moon, Nolin <Nolin.Moon@dep.state.fl.us> wrote:

Mr. Hart,

| am able to access the documents. The Department’s administrative staff will upload the
documents to our online records repository and enter the application into the permitting
database. You should receive an email confirmation by Tuesday.

Sincerely,

Nolin W. Moon, P.E.

Professional Engineer Il

(239) 344-5672

FDEP South District Office
2295 Victoria Avenue, Ste 364
P.O. Box 2549

Fort Myers, FL 33902-2549
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WHERRY

TRUCK LINES, INC.
Walling Floor Bulk Transport

Green Waste Disposal

Horticultural Waste Removal

December 11. 2014

Rob Weber

Garden Street Iron & Metal Inc.
3350 Metro Pkwy

Fort Myers, FL 33916

Wherry Truck Lines will load, haul and dispose of used tires located at 3350 Metro
Pkwy in Fort Myers for the following rates for approximately 8,000 car and truck

tires:

- Mobilize loader in - $350
- Mobilize loader out - $350
- Loader - $85/hr

- Tires hauled to Lee County Waste to Energy (incinerator) located at 10550
Buckingham Rd. Fort Myers - $250 per 100 yard walking floor trailer load

— Freight only
- Disposal rate for passenger tires - $51.50 per ton
- Disposal rate for OTR tires - $110.00 per ton

All agreements are contingent upon accidents or delays beyond our control.

o Auto Liability Insurance of $1,000,000.00
e Full Workman's Compensation is carried on all employees
e General Liability Insurance of $2,000,000.00

Terms of Payment: Due upon receipt
Federal Tax ID# 650339512

ACCEPTANCE OF SERVICE AGREEMENT

The above prices, specifications and conditions are satisfactory and are hereby
accepted. You are authorized to do the work as specified. This quote will be valid
for 1 year.

e U ,u/ 4 l

Kendell T. Wherry Rob eber
Wherry Truck Lines, !nC , Garden Street Iron & Metal Inc.
, /

P.O. Box 61008 — Fort Myers. Florida 33906-1008

Phone 239-768-1293 Fax 239-768-6332






From: Jonathan Hart [mailto:jonathan.keenefl@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, November 25, 2014 3:06 PM

To: Moon, Nolin
Cc: Tim Keene
Subject: Waste Tire Permit Renewal, WACS ID 00098386

Mr. Moon,

Use the link below to FDEP's FTP site to download the transmittal letter along with the
above referenced permit renewal application and all attachments. We will place the check
for the application fee in the mail today.

ftp://ftp.dep.state.fl.us/pub/incoming/SD_NewApps/Garden%20Street%20Iron%20Metal/

Please email me back once you have successfully downloaded all the documents.

Thank you and have a great Thanksgiving!

Jonathan Hart

Project Manager

Keene Development LLC
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0 239.939.0524 M 239.603.3142

Thank you. Tim Keene.

DEVELOPMENT, LLC

CONSTRUCTION = ENGINEERING = REAL ESTATE

Tim Keene, PE, MBA, CBC, CGC
Keene Engineering, Inc.

Keene Development LLC

(239) 939-0524

(239) 244-8299 fax

(239) 770-4221 cell

PE 45915

CBC 1256937

CGC 1521288

Office Address:

10970 S. Cleveland Ave., Ste 510
Fort Myers, Florida 33907
Mailing Address:

PO Box 2770

Fort Myers, Florida 33902
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