Patino, Jorge R

From: Emilio Perez <tuiwarehouse@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2015 3:02 PM

To: Patino, Jorge R

Subject: Re: DRAFT Permit 333423-001-WT — Forever Recycling LLC Waste Tire Processing
Facility

Attachments: Forever Recycling Proof Newspaper ad 20151027.pdf

Dear Mr. Patino,

Please find attached copy of newspaper ad and the paid receipt for cost of running ad in Palm Beach Post
newspaper with the legal notice.
If there is anything else required please advise.

Thank you,

Metra Hughes,

Forever Recycling

246 E. Main Street
Pahokee, FL 33476

(561) 924-9250 Office
(561) 924-9252 Fax
tuiwarehouse@yahoo.com

On Friday, October 23, 2015 1:57 PM, Emilio Perez <tuiwarehouse @yahoo.com> wrote:

Acknowledgement received email.
Thank you very much for your time.
Metra Hughes

Forever Recycling

246 E. Main Street
Pahokee, FL 33476

(561) 924-9250 Office
(561) 924-9252 Fax
tuiwarehouse@yahoo.com

On Friday, October 23, 2015 1:42 PM, "Patino, Jorge R" <Jorge.Patino@flhealth.gov> wrote:

Dear Mr. Perez:



RE: DRAFT Permit No. 333423-001-WT — Forever Recycling LLC Waste Tire Processing Facility

One copy of the Draft Permit is attached. The attached document is in Adobe PDF format. Adobe
Acrobat Reader is required to view this document and a free reader can be downloaded from
www.adobe.com.

Please let me know if you wish to receive a hard copy of this document.

We respectfully request that you acknowledge the receipt of this email.

If you have any questions or comments, please contact me at 561-837-5936.

Thanks,

Jorge Patino, P.E.

Air & Solid Waste Permitting and Compliance
Department of Health Palm Beach County
800 Clematis Street, 4th Floor

West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Office: (561) 837-5974

FAX: (561) 837-5295

www.pbchd.com
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Real News Starts Here
RECEIPT
Account:  P66206 Phone: 561-924-9250
Name: FOREVER RECYCLING E-mail:
Address: 248 E MAIN ST
PAHOKEE FL. 33476-1808

Order Name: PUBLIC NOTICE Order Summary
Order Id: 502083 Base: $571.04
Original Order id: Cther Charges: $0.00
Copy Line: PUBLIC NOTICE OF INTENT TO ISSUEWASTE T Discounts: $0.00
Sales Rep: PB116 R Hindmarch {F) Agency Commission: $0.00
Purchase Order: Sales Tax: $0.00
Pay Type: Credit Card Total Order $57104
Account Group:
Calter: METRA HUGHES Payment Summary

Credit Card $571.04
Section: 6205 Legal Notices Total Payment: $571.04
Reply Request:
Tear Sheets: o
COXMedia Group

A Division of COX Enterprises, inc.
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RECEIPT

Ad Name: 953612A Ad Id: 853612 Original Ad Id:
Start: 1072712015

Stop: 10/2712015

Issues; 1

Words: a21

Dimensions: 1 X 166

Color:

Editions

PB Post

PB Post Web
COXMedia Group

A Division of COX Enterprises, Inc.
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Real News Starts Here

RECEIPT

COXMedia Group
A Division of COX Enterprises, Inc.
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RECEIPT

Ad shown is not actual print size.

COXMedia Group
A Division of COX Enterprises, inc.










