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Tift, Rachel

From: Tift, Rachel
Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2018 5:46 PM
To: 'John Arnold'
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group; Morgan, Steve (Steve.Morgan@dep.state.fl.us); Tafuni, Steven; 

Black, Alexis; Madden, Melissa; 'GBleau@angelosrm.com'; 'jcummins@cantwellcummins.com'
Subject: 2018 Cost Estimate Approval, Enterprise Class III Landfill & Waste Tire Processing Facility, WACS ID 

No. 87895
Attachments: Revised 2018 Enterprise CLIII Closure and Lont Term Care Update Package WACS 87895.pdf

Dear Mr. Arnold: 
 
This correspondence is to acknowledge receipt of the inflation‐adjusted cost estimates, dated and received February 7, 
2018, for closure and long‐term care of Enterprise Class III Landfill. The cost estimates received February 7, 2018, (total 
for closing $3,414,199.88 and long‐term care $94,865.01/year x 30 years = $2,845,950.30) are APPROVED for 2018. The 
approved cost estimates are for closing and long‐term care of 67 acres (Cells 1‐7, 15 & 16). The next update (revised 
estimates) is due with the upcoming permit renewal application. A permit renewal reminder will follow this e‐mail. 
 
This correspondence is also to acknowledge receipt of the inflation‐adjusted cost estimates, dated and received 
February 6, 2018, for closure of the Enterprise Waste Tire Processing Facility. The cost estimates received February 6, 
2018 (total for closing $144,337.23) are APPROVED for 2018. The approved estimates are for a total of approximately 
2,028 tons of waste tires at the site at any time. The next annual update (revised or inflation‐adjusted estimates) is due 
no later than March 1, 2019. 
 
A copy of these estimates is forwarded, via this email, to the Solid Waste Financial Coordinator at 
Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us. Financial assurance documents can be sent to: Solid Waste Section, 
FDEP, 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399‐2407. Please work with the coordinator directly to 
assess the facility’s compliance with the funding mechanism requirements of Rule 62‐701.630, F.A.C. 
 
Further information about Solid Waste Financial Assurance can be found at the Department’s website at: 
https://floridadep.gov/waste/permitting‐compliance‐assistance/content/solid‐waste‐financial‐assurance.  
 
Best Regards, 
 

Rachel Tift 
Engineering Specialist II 

Florida Department of Environmental Protection 

Southwest District 

13051 N. Telecom Parkway, Suite 101 

Temple Terrace, FL 33637‐0926 

Rachel.Tift@floridadep.gov  

Direct line: 813.470.5755 

Fax:  813.470.5996 
 
Permitting Consistency Initiative: The Florida Department of Environmental Protection is committed to providing efficient, consistent
and quality service to the citizens of Florida. In keeping with these objectives, we continue to identify ongoing improvements to our 
permitting process by standardizing and simplifying our documents.   

 

From: John Arnold [mailto:john.phillip.arnold@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2018 2:58 PM 
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To: Financial Assurance Working Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>; SWD_Waste 
<SWD_Waste@dep.state.fl.us>; Glen Bleau <GBleau@angelosrm.com>; James Cummins 
<jcummins@cantwellcummins.com> 
Subject: Revised WACS 87895 2018 Financial Assurance Update 
 
 
 
 
‐‐  
John Arnold, P.E. 
Ph.   (813) 477‐1719 

From: Tift, Rachel  
Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2018 3:08 PM 
To: 'john.phillip.arnold@gmail.com' <john.phillip.arnold@gmail.com> 
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>; 
'lisa@locklearconsulting.com' <lisa@locklearconsulting.com>; 'john@locklearconsulting.com' 
<john@locklearconsulting.com>; Morgan, Steve (Steve.Morgan@dep.state.fl.us) <Steve.Morgan@dep.state.fl.us>; 
Madden, Melissa <Melissa.Madden@dep.state.fl.us> 
Subject: RE: WACS 87895 ‐ Enterprise CLIII and Waste Tire Processing Facility 2018 Financial Assurance Update 
 
Good afternoon Mr. Arnold, 
 
Based on Ms. Baker’s letter dated January 30, 2017 regarding the closure cost estimates for the Class III Landfill, it 
appears that the starting figures used in the 2018 Closure Cost Estimating Form should be $3,370,384.88 for closing 
costs and $93,647.59 ($2,809,427.72 / 30 years) for long term care costs before applying the inflation factor of 1.013. A 
highlighted excerpt from the letter is included below for convenience. The values currently used in the Closure Cost 
Estimating Form are from 2016 and were not adjusted using the 2017 inflation factor. Please review and revise the 
Closure Cost Estimating Form for the Class III Landfill as appropriate.  
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Thanks & Best Regards, 
 

Rachel Tift 
Engineering Specialist II 

Florida Department of Environmental Protection 

Southwest District 

13051 N. Telecom Parkway, Suite 101 

Temple Terrace, FL 33637‐0926 

Rachel.Tift@floridadep.gov  

Direct line: 813.470.5755 

Fax:  813.470.5996 
 
Permitting Consistency Initiative: The Florida Department of Environmental Protection is committed to providing efficient, consistent
and quality service to the citizens of Florida. In keeping with these objectives, we continue to identify ongoing improvements to our
permitting process by standardizing and simplifying our documents.   

From: John Arnold [mailto:john.phillip.arnold@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, February 6, 2018 1:14 PM 
To: SWD_Waste <SWD_Waste@dep.state.fl.us> 
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>; Glen Bleau 
<GBleau@angelosrm.com>; ljbaker23@outlook.com <lisa@locklearconsulting.com>; John Locklear 
<john@locklearconsulting.com>; James Cummins <jcummins@cantwellcummins.com> 
Subject: Re: WACS 87895 ‐ Enterprise CLIII and Waste Tire Processing Facility 2018 Financial Assurance Updatee 
 
Consolidated PDF with 2018 Class III and WTPF  update (inflation factor used). 
 
On Tue, Feb 6, 2018 at 1:03 PM, John Arnold <john.phillip.arnold@gmail.com> wrote: 
The 2018 financial assurance updates for the Class III landfill and Waste Tire Processing Facility located in Dade City, 
Pasco County, Florida area attached. 
 
Please let me know if you have any questions, or if you need any additional information. 
 
Sincerely, 
‐‐  
John Arnold, P.E. 
Ph.   (813) 477‐1719 

‐‐  
John Arnold, P.E. 
Ph.   (813) 477‐1719 
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