AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION
THE LEDGER
Lakeland, Polk County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA)
COUNTY OF POLK)

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared Olga L.
Rodriguez Martin, who on oath says that she is an Account
Executive for Advertising at The Ledger, the owner of The Ledger,
a daily newspaper published at Lakeland in Polk County, Florida;
that the attached copy of advertisement, being a

PUBLIC NOTICE

In the matter of ROBERT AND SONS TIRES CORP.

Concerning _WASTE TIRE PROCESSING FACILITY

was published in newspaper and on-line in the issues of
6-25; 2020

Affiant further says that said The Ledger is a newspaper published
at Lakeland, in said Polk County, Florida, and that the said
newspaper has heretofore been continuously published in said Polk
County Florida, daily, and has been entered as second class matter
at the post office in Lakeland, in said Polk County, Florida, for a
period of one year next preceding the first publication of the
attached copy of advertisement; and affiant further says that she has
neither paid nor promised any person, firm or corporation any
discount, rebate, commission or refund for the purpose of securing
this advertisement for publication in the said newspaper.

Signed.. g

‘ca L. Rodriguez Martin
‘Advertising Account Executive
Who is personally known to me.

. 2020

(Seal)

PATRICIA ANN ROUSE

PUBLIC NOTICE

The Department of Environmental
Protection announces receipt of an
application for garmit from Robert and
Sons Tires Corp, to construct, oper-
ate and close a waste tire processing
1aciiii%‘ This project will be lecated at
507 Nilsen Street, Haines City, FL

' § 33844 in Polk County. This applica-

tion is being processed and is avail-
able for public inspection during nor-
mal business hours, 8:00 a.m. to 5:00
p.m., Monday through Friday, except
legal holidays, at the Department's
Southwest District office located at
13051 N. Telecom Parkway, Temple

Terrace, FL.
6-25; 2020 JORK




Wargo, Emily

From: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:34 PM

To: Wargo, Emily; Morgan, Steve

Subject: FW: Re: Proof of Your Ad LO60GOJIRK (see Attachment) PAYMENT RECEIP
Attachments: AFF FOR ROBERT AND SONS.pdf; RE: RE: Roberto and sons tires financial assurance

Hi Emily/Steve,
Please find attached the Proof of Publication for the Notice of Application for the Robert and Sons Tires Corp WTPF in
Haines City. Since | think it will further delay the completion of the application, and based on Steve’s email attached, |

am not going to submit a revised application form. | appreciate the Department’s flexibility on this.

| am also checking with Tor to get an update on financial assurance status. The other pending item is the fire safety
survey. | asked Mr. Vargas about it last week, but did not get an answer. | will try again.

Thank-you for your patience on this project.

Sugan Pely

X i Susan J. Pelz, P.E.
President

£ s 812.447.0054 [cfflce voloamall)

Reeniet g1s 418 1030 joall)

Except as provided under Florida®s Sunshine Law, this @mall and any flles tramsmitted with It ape
confidentlal and Intended solely for the use of the Individual or éntlty to whom they ane addressed, If
wou ane not the Intended reciplent, wou are notified that disclesing, copying, distributing or taking any
action In regands to the content of this emall or transmitbed Flies are stricthy prohiblted. If you have
recehsed this emall In @rror, please notify the sender Immediately and delete the emall and any related
transmitted Flles from wour system. Thank you foryour cooperation and we apologize for amy
Incomenience.

From: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 11:44 AM

To: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com

Subject: FW: Re: Proof of Your Ad LO60G0OJIRK (see Attachment) PAYMENT RECEIP



Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7, an AT&T 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Rouse, Patricia" <PRouse@localig.com>

Date: 6/26/20 10:42 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Subject: Re: Proof of Your Ad LO60GOJIRK (see Attachment) PAYMENT RECEIP

YES, SEE ATTACHED. This will be mailed out today.

From: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 9:44 AM

To: Patti Rouse (Google) <patti.rouse@theledger.com>

Subject: RE: Proof of Your Ad LO60G0OJIRK (see Attachment) PAYMENT RECEIP

Gm Patti
Is there a way to get a copy of the affidavit.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7, an AT&T 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: Patti Rouse <Patti.Rouse@theledger.com>

Date: 6/22/20 12:17 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: marlinperla86@yahoo.com

Subject: Proof of Your Ad LO60GOJIRK (see Attachment) PAYMENT RECEIP

To view your proof open it with Adobe Acrobat.
If you need Adobe Acrobat it can be downloaded
free of charge from http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/

This message may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you
are not the intended recipient or authorized to receive this for the
intended recipient, you must not use, copy, disclose or take any action
based on this message or any information herein. If you have received this
message in error, please advise the sender immediately by sending a reply
e-mail and delete this message. Thank you for your cooperation.

This message may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or authorized to
receive this for the intended recipient, you must not use, copy, disclose or take any action based on this message or any
information herein. If you have received this message in error, please advise the sender immediately by sending a reply e-
mail and delete this message. Thank you for your cooperation.
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