Wargo, Emily

From: Bejnar, Tor

Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2020 10:24 AM

To: Wargo, Emily

Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires Corp. financial assurance
Nothing.

Please contact me if you have any questions.

Tor Bejnar

Environmental Specialist Il

Financial Assurance Working Group, Permitting & Compliance Assistance Program
Division of Waste Management, Department of Environmental Protection

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Working from home usual hours: 8:00am-4:00pm

Website URL: Financial Assurance Programs

Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials are public records and may be made available to the public or
media upon request. This e-mail communication, your reply, and future e-mails to my attention may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 05, 2020 10:14 AM

To: Bejnar, Tor <Tor.Bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>

Cc: Morgan, Steve <Steve.Morgan@FloridaDEP.gov>; Madden, Melissa <Melissa.Madden@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires Corp. financial assurance

Good morning Tor,

Have you received any draft or original financial assurance documentation for this site (WACS ID: 106464)?

Thank you,

Emily Wargo

Engineering Specialist 11

Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District
Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov

Office: 813-470-5942

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Electronic communications regarding state business are public records
available upon request. Your e-mail communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Bejnar, Tor <Tor.Bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>
Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 3:45 PM




To: robertandsonsdistributor@gmail.com; Susan@PelzEnvServices.com
Cc: Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>; Morgan, Steve <Steve.Morgan@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires Corp. financial assurance

Dear Mr. Vargas and Ms. Pelz:

I’m not aware of having received any copy (so I can do a courtesy review) or original financial
assurance documentation. Have I missed something?

Please contact me if you have any questions.

Tor Bejnar

Environmental Specialist Il

Financial Assurance Working Group, Permitting & Compliance Assistance Program
Division of Waste Management, Department of Environmental Protection

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Working from home usual hours: 8:00am-4:00pm

Website URL: Financial Assurance Programs

Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials are public records and may be made available to the public or
media upon request. This e-mail communication, your reply, and future e-mails to my attention may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: Bejnar, Tor

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 5:20 PM

To: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com

Cc: Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@floridadep.gov>; Morgan, Steve <Steve.Morgan@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires Corp. financial assurance

Susan,
See attached e-mail sent on Wednesday.

Please contact me if you have any questions.

Tor Bejnar

Environmental Specialist Il

Financial Assurance Working Group, Permitting & Compliance Assistance Program
Division of Waste Management, Department of Environmental Protection

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Working part time from home usual hours: 10:00am-3:00pm

Website URL: Financial Assurance Programs

Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials are public records and may be made available to the public or
media upon request. This e-mail communication, your reply, and future e-mails to my attention may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com <Susan@PelzEnvServices.com>

Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:34 PM

To: Bejnar, Tor <Tor.Bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>

Cc: Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>; Morgan, Steve <Steve.Morgan@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: Robert and Sons Tires Corp. financial assurance

Hi Tor,



| hope you are well. I’'m following up on last couple of items needed to complete the Waste Tire Processing Facility
permit application. Do you have an update on the status of Mr. Vargas’ financial assurance?

Thanks for your help,
Have a great weekend,

Sarsan ). Palz, PE.
President

Swan@PelrEwsanices com
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