Wargo, Emily

From: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 3:47 PM

To: Wargo, Emily

Cc: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com; Jon DeClue; 'Joelia Ojeda’; RJ Tires
Subject: RE: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hi Emily

We are currently working now with a different company to try to get the Bond needed | have attached him on this email
as well he is just waiting on our financial statements that he will have here shortly to see if approved or see what route
we will need to take.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7, an AT&T 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Wargo, Emily" <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>
Date: 1/7/21 3:04 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Cc: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com

Subject: RE: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hi Marlin,

Can you please provide an update on the status of the bond?

Thank you,

Emily Wargo

Engineering Specialist I1
Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District

Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov

Office: 813-470-5942



PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Electronic communications regarding state business are public records
available upon request. Your e-mail communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com <Susan@PelzEnvServices.com>

Sent: Friday, December 11, 2020 7:40 AM

To: 'marlinperla86' <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>; 'Cindy Mirisola' <CMirisola@sihle.com>; 'Joelia Ojeda’
<ojeda29j@yahoo.com>

Cc: Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>; Bejnar, Tor <Tor.Bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>; Morgan, Steve
<Steve.Morgan@FloridaDEP.gov>; Madden, Melissa <Melissa.Madden@FloridaDEP.gov>

Subject: RE: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hi Marlin,

Yes it is a closure bond, but Tor Bejnar in Tallahassee can explain it better than | can. The bonding company can contact
him directly for more information.

Thanks,



Sarsan ). Palz, P.E.
Preskdent

$13.4a7.0054 [office voicemail)
S13.416. 1030 [call)

Excapt 21 provided andar Rordda’s Sunshing Line, this amall and any Ifas ranamitted with & ara
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¥ou ara not the fntended reciplent. you ara notifled that discfoting, copying. distributing or taking any
action in regands to the content of this eenall or tramymitted Fies are strictly prohibited. IF you have
racaled this emall in arrar, slaace notly the sendar immediataly and dalabe the amall and arw ralabed
transmitted Mles froem your systent. Thank wou foryowr cooparation and we apsiogion for any

From: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 12:16 PM

To: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com; Cindy Mirisola <CMirisola@sihle.com>; 'Joelia Ojeda' <ojeda29j@yahoo.com>
Subject: FW: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hi Suzan

Do you know exacly what type of bond we need to provide?

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7, an AT&T 4G LTE smartphone



From: Cindy Mirisola <CMirisola@sihle.com>

Date: 12/10/20 11:53 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: marilyn sanchez <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

HI Marilyn — I'm working on this bond for you, it appears this information you sent me from the DEP is for a
facility closure bond.

Are we closing a facility? I was under the impression that you needed a bond for the Waste Tire Disposal Fees
for the City of Haines City?

Am I not correct, you actually have a waste facility that is being closed and the DEP is requiring a Closure
bond? If so, I don't have a market for Closure bonds...

Did Viking Bonds no provide any help in placing the bond for you? Thanks for your help.

Cindy Mirisola

Bonds Account Manager

Sihle Insurance Group

"The Difference is Service"

-
Sll’]le 0: 407.389.3588 | | F: 407.389.8488
- i Main Office: 407.869.0962
BURANCE GRON CMirisola@sihle.com | www.Sihle.com
1021 Douglas Avenue, Altamonte Springs, FL 32714

Business Insurance / Personal Insurance / Employee Benefits / Payroll / Since 1974!
Please consider the environment before printing this email message.

From: marilyn sanchez <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, December 7, 2020 9:10 PM




To: Cindy Mirisola <CMirisola@sihle.com>; Joelia Ojeda <ojeda29j@yahoo.com>
Subject: Fw: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Let me know if this information helps you out our if you need more.

From: Bejnar, Tor <tor.bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>

To: Samantha Moore <samantham@yvbsbond.com>

Cc: Susan@PelzEnvServices.com <Susan@PelzEnvServices.com>; marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>;
'ojeda29j@yahoo.com’ <ojeda29j@yahoo.com>; robertandsonsdistributor@gmail.com
<robertandsonsdistributor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 31, 2020, 08:14:53 AM EDT

Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Dear Ms. Moore:

A quick overview of Solid Waste Financial Assurance can be found in the introductory 12-slide
PowerPoint (pdf) presentation on our Financial Assurance website. DEP forms must be used and are
available on our Forms and Form Guidance page.

Some specifics for the Robert and Sons tire facility that needs to be covered:
What needs to be covered: Closing [check box]

Principal (owner or operator): Robert and Sons Tires Corp. [exactly as identified in Sunbiz.org,
except for capitalization]

Type of legal entity: corporation

FDEP I.D. No.: WACS 73750

Facility Name: RJ Tires

Site Address: 507 Nilsen St., Haines City, Florida

Cost estimate that must be covered (minimum Penal Sum of bond): $49,147.74



Please contact me directly if you have any questions. I’ll be happy to provide a courtesy review of a
pre-signed copy of a bond.

Dear Mr. Vargas:

Remember: when using a surety bond for financial assurance, a standby trust fund agreement must
also be established and maintained. If your bank is not interested or eligible to provide this
documentation, you might want to look at the Provider Companies list on our website.

Please contact me if you have any questions.

Tor Bejnar

Environmental Specialist Ill
Financial Assurance Working Group, Permitting & Compliance Assistance Program
Division of Waste Management, Department of Environmental Protection

2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Working from home usual hours: 8:00am-4:00pm

Website URL: Financial Assurance Programs

Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials are public records and may be made available to the public or
media upon request. This e-mail communication, your reply, and future e-mails to my attention may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: marlinperla86 <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 6:07 PM

To: Samantha Moore <samantham@vbsbond.com>; 'ojeda29j@yahoo.com' <ojeda29j@yahoo.com>
Cc: Bejnar, Tor <Tor.Bejnar@dep.state.fl.us>; Susan@PelzEnvServices.com

Subject: RE: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hi Mr.Tor and Ms Susan
We are working with Samantha from Viking bond service

And as you can read below she is still needing some info and | was wondering if we can get some assistance from either
one so we can get this taken care of.

Thanks for all the help.



Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7, an AT&T 4G LTE smartphone

From: Samantha Moore <samantham@vbsbond.com>

Date: 8/28/20 5:39 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "marlinperla86@yahoo.com™ <marlinperla86@yahoo.com>, "ojeda29j@yahoo.com™ <ojeda29j@yahoo.com>

Subject: Robert and Sons Tires; BondStar: 73750

Hello,

I am working on the request for the Facility closure bond you sent an application over for. | am still needing
some more information to see what the bond requirement is and bond forms.

From the info you provided, it looks like the bond would be required by Haines City, FL, | think. That is who we would be
making the bond payable to in the event of claims. We need to know what the bond requirement is that surety is going to
be backing. Please provide something from Haines City, that shows the bond requirement and includes a bond form they
require or a sample of a bond they have accepted in the past.

COVID-19 Notice - The CDC and the State of Arizona have recommended that employees work from home if at all
possible and therefore the majority of our staff will be following these guidelines. We are fully staffed and can
respond immediately, however there may be delays that exist outside of our control. We thank you for your
patience during this time.

Samantha Moore
Commercial Bond Producer

Viking Bond Service, Inc.
22601 N. 19th Ave. Suite 210
Phoenix, AZ 85027

Toll Free: 888-2-SURETY (888-278-7389)
Voice: 623-933-9334 Ext 6705
Fax: 623-933-9376



Hours: Mon-Thurs- 8am-5pm & Fri 8am-3:30pm MST

Complete an Online Application
samantham@vbsbond.com
www.performancesuretybonds.com

Viking

Bond Service, Inc.

| = Facebook |

The information contained herein is confidential. Access to this information by anyone other than the addressee(s) is
unauthorized. If you are not the named recipient(s) or authorized by the named recipient(s), any dissemination, distribution,
or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.




