


Hello Karen, 
 
I have received, reviewed and approved the above attached closure cost estimates for an amount of $ 
68080.00 for the Year 2014. 
 
Please contact Susan Eldredge at 850-245-8740 or e-mail susan.eldredge@dep.state.fl.us 
To update the Financial Assurance Mechanism (Performance Bond) by on or before May 1, 2014. 
 
If you have any questions with this approval, please let me know. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Bheem R. Kothur, P.E., DEE 
Hazardous Waste Program & Permitting   
 
From: kav55@aol.com [mailto:kav55@aol.com]  
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2014 11:59 AM 
To: Kothur, Bheem 
Subject: Re: Fuels Unlimited ; Facility I.DNo: FLR 000 050 369; 
 
Bheem,    
 
I am attaching the 2014 Closure Cost Estimate Form.  It was nice to speak to you today. 
 
Thank you, 
Karen Violet 
 
 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Kothur, Bheem <Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us> 
To: 'kav55@aol.com' <kav55@aol.com> 
Cc: Eldredge, Susan F. <Susan.F.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us>; White, John <John.White@dep.state.fl.us> 
Sent: Mon, Mar 17, 2014 4:10 pm 
Subject: Fuels Unlimited ; Facility I.DNo: FLR 000 050 369; 

Hi Karen, 
As you the submittal of the revised closure cost estimates are past due.  
The deadline was February 28, 2014 for the year 2014.   
  
If you have any questions, please let me know. 
  
Bheem R. Kothur, P.E., DEE 
Professional Engineer III 
DWM/BS&HW/HW Regulation Section 
Florida Department of Environmental Protection 
MS# 4560, 2600 Blair Stone Road 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400 
Tel: 850-245-8781, FAX: 850-245-8810 
Email: Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us 
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http://survey.dep.state.fl.us/?refemail=Bheem.Kothur@dep.state.fl.us
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