
Receipt for Payment

October 05, 2020

OGC
Number:

201345

 

Receipt
Number:

41236

 

Payment(s)
made by:

samantha hageman

Address: 6635 Willow Park Drive

City, State Zip: Naples, FL 34109

 

On behalf of:

 

Responsible
Party:

ESH FORT MYERS, LLC
SETH MENDELSOHN

Address: 23500 SHELBURNE ROAD 
SHAKER HEIGHTS, OH 44122, US

Thank you for making your scheduled DEP Order Payment(s). 

From: Figueroa, Yvonne
To: Owens, Cindy
Subject: FW: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt
Date: Tuesday, October 6, 2020 7:42:33 AM
Attachments: image001.png

 
fyi
From: no-reply@dep.state.fl.us <no-reply@dep.state.fl.us> 
Sent: Monday, October 5, 2020 3:38 PM
To: sami.hageman@deangelisdiamond.com
Cc: Figueroa, Yvonne <Yvonne.Figueroa@FloridaDEP.gov>; Ades, Amanda <Amanda.Ades@FloridaDEP.gov>;
OGC_ESSAOrderPayment <OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@floridadep.gov>
Subject: FDEP Penalty Payment(s) Receipt
 

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF
Environmental Protection

 
Bob Martinez Center

2600 Blair Stone Road
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400

Ron DeSantis
Governor

 
Jeanette Nuñez

Lt. Governor
 

Noah Valenstein
Secretary

mailto:Yvonne.Figueroa@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Cindy.Owens@FloridaDEP.gov






You have paid $19,250.00. This represents payment of the following scheduled Order Payment(s):

Payment Due Date: 10/19/2020 $19,250.00

Total Paid $19,250.00

If you have any questions, please contact the Office of General Counsel at (850) 245-2268 or by e-mail
at OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@dep.state.fl.us.

 

mailto:OGC_ESSAOrderPayment@dep.state.fl.us

