
Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Cashlisting By Deposit Summary Report

    Run Date 2022-01-25 09:55
Report Criteria

Begin Deposit Number 07055N
End Deposit Number 07055N

End Cashlisting Number 99999999

Cashlisting Cashlist Area Description
229577 NED NORTHEAST DISTRICT-JACKSONVILLE

Deposit No Date Deposited Contact
07055N 01/19/2022 ALISHA SIMPSON

Rev Code ODN Revenue Object Description Total

012008 012008 LCT-PENALTIES 19,500.00

018003 018003 LCT-REIMB.LEGAL COST 1,000.00

Cashlisting 229577 Total: $20,500.00
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Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Cashlisting By Deposit Report

    Run Date 2022-01-25 09:55
Report Criteria

Begin Deposit Number 07055N
End Deposit Number 07055N

End Cashlisting Number 99999999

Cashlisting Cashlist Area Description
229577 NED NORTHEAST DISTRICT-JACKSONVILLE

Deposit No Date Deposited Contact
07055N 01/19/2022 ALISHA SIMPSON

Rev Code
ODN

Revenue
Object

Transmittal Dep DDN Receipt
Number

Pre-
Numbered

Receipt

Name Check
Number

Payment Amount Reference
Account

Payment
Number

Remittance
Number

Fund Grant Project BPIN

012008 012008 0 101959 BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE
INC

WIRE 19,500.00 211018 1830456 1509405 WQATF

Rev Code ODN 012008 Subtotal: $19,500.00

018003 018003 0 101959 BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE
INC

WIRE 1,000.00 211018 1830457 1509405 WQATF

Rev Code ODN 018003 Subtotal: $1,000.00

Cashlisting 229577 Total: $20,500.00
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From: Roughton, Laurie
To: Treadwell, Michelle D
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene
Subject: RE: OGC 21-1018
Date: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:53:57 AM
Attachments: image005.png

Hi Michelle,
 
Reference           211018
Cashlist area       NED
Fund                     WQATF
Object codes      $19,500 (012008 penalties);   $1,000  (018003  expenses)
 
Let me know if you need anything else.
 

Laurie Roughton, Legal Assistant
Department of Environmental Protection
Office of General Counsel
Research Assistant
3900 Commonwealth Blvd., MS 35
Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
Office: 850-245-2268

 

From: Treadwell, Michelle D <Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:49 AM
To: Roughton, Laurie <Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov>
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene <Arlene.Wilkinson@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: OGC 21-1018
 
Laurie,
 
I got a wire in for OGC 21-1018. How should I post this?
 

 
Thank You,
 
 

Michelle D. Treadwell
Accounting Specialist
Department of Environmental Protection

mailto:Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Arlene.Wilkinson@FloridaDEP.gov
https://clicktime.symantec.com/34R6bNKkmvzY6mprft8JgVx7Vc?u=https%3A%2F%2Fnam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%3Furl%3Dhttps%253A%252F%252Ffloridadep.gov%252F%26data%3D02%257C01%257C%257C411e75192c534bf0a69d08d7b15cc7b7%257C8a807b9b02da47f3a903791a42a2285c%257C0%257C1%257C637172884795269474%26sdata%3DSECBCsWOp%252FdSlyAkuO2ASm8IO1ih7PHiPFtE60TSYn4%253D%26reserved%3D0
mailto:Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov

Wire Transfers

Remittance [ 1509405 Received Date * [01/1912022 L
Check#* [ WIRE Amount* 2050000

Name * [BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE Il

Addressi |





From: Treadwell, Michelle D
To: Roughton, Laurie
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene; Melvin,Tabbatha; Beebe, Erica
Subject: RE: OGC 21-1018
Date: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 10:10:14 AM
Attachments: 07055N - NED LCT - $20500.00.pdf

image004.png

Here’s the cash listing
 
Thank You,
 
 

         

Michelle D. Treadwell
Accounting Specialist
Department of Environmental Protection
Bureau of Finance and Accounting
Michelle.D.Treadwell@floridadep.gov
Office: 850.245.2367

 

 Please consider the environment before printing this email
 

From: Roughton, Laurie <Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:54 AM
To: Treadwell, Michelle D <Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov>
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene <Arlene.Wilkinson@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: RE: OGC 21-1018
 
Hi Michelle,
 
Reference           211018
Cashlist area       NED
Fund                     WQATF
Object codes      $19,500 (012008 penalties);   $1,000  (018003  expenses)
 
Let me know if you need anything else.
 

Laurie Roughton, Legal Assistant
Department of Environmental Protection
Office of General Counsel
Research Assistant
3900 Commonwealth Blvd., MS 35
Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
Office: 850-245-2268

 
 

From: Treadwell, Michelle D <Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:49 AM

mailto:Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Arlene.Wilkinson@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Tabbatha.Melvin@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Erica.Beebe@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Michelle.D.Treadwell@floridadep.gov
https://clicktime.symantec.com/34R6bNKkmvzY6mprft8JgVx7Vc?u=https%3A%2F%2Fnam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%3Furl%3Dhttps%253A%252F%252Ffloridadep.gov%252F%26data%3D02%257C01%257C%257C411e75192c534bf0a69d08d7b15cc7b7%257C8a807b9b02da47f3a903791a42a2285c%257C0%257C1%257C637172884795269474%26sdata%3DSECBCsWOp%252FdSlyAkuO2ASm8IO1ih7PHiPFtE60TSYn4%253D%26reserved%3D0
mailto:Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
mailto:Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov



Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Cashlisting By Deposit Summary Report


    Run Date 2022-01-25 09:55
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Begin Deposit Number 07055N
End Deposit Number 07055N


End Cashlisting Number 99999999


Cashlisting Cashlist Area Description
229577 NED NORTHEAST DISTRICT-JACKSONVILLE


Deposit No Date Deposited Contact
07055N 01/19/2022 ALISHA SIMPSON


Rev Code ODN Revenue Object Description Total


012008 012008 LCT-PENALTIES 19,500.00


018003 018003 LCT-REIMB.LEGAL COST 1,000.00
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Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Cashlisting By Deposit Report


    Run Date 2022-01-25 09:55
Report Criteria


Begin Deposit Number 07055N
End Deposit Number 07055N


End Cashlisting Number 99999999


Cashlisting Cashlist Area Description
229577 NED NORTHEAST DISTRICT-JACKSONVILLE


Deposit No Date Deposited Contact
07055N 01/19/2022 ALISHA SIMPSON


Rev Code
ODN


Revenue
Object


Transmittal Dep DDN Receipt
Number


Pre-
Numbered


Receipt


Name Check
Number


Payment Amount Reference
Account


Payment
Number


Remittance
Number


Fund Grant Project BPIN


012008 012008 0 101959 BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE
INC


WIRE 19,500.00 211018 1830456 1509405 WQATF


Rev Code ODN 012008 Subtotal: $19,500.00


018003 018003 0 101959 BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE
INC


WIRE 1,000.00 211018 1830457 1509405 WQATF


Rev Code ODN 018003 Subtotal: $1,000.00


Cashlisting 229577 Total: $20,500.00
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From: Roughton, Laurie
To: Treadwell, Michelle D
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene
Subject: RE: OGC 21-1018
Date: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:53:57 AM
Attachments: image005.png


Hi Michelle,
 
Reference           211018
Cashlist area       NED
Fund                     WQATF
Object codes      $19,500 (012008 penalties);   $1,000  (018003  expenses)
 
Let me know if you need anything else.
 


Laurie Roughton, Legal Assistant
Department of Environmental Protection
Office of General Counsel
Research Assistant
3900 Commonwealth Blvd., MS 35
Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov
Office: 850-245-2268


 


From: Treadwell, Michelle D <Michelle.D.Treadwell@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 9:49 AM
To: Roughton, Laurie <Laurie.Roughton@FloridaDEP.gov>
Cc: Wilkinson, Arlene <Arlene.Wilkinson@FloridaDEP.gov>
Subject: OGC 21-1018
 
Laurie,
 
I got a wire in for OGC 21-1018. How should I post this?
 


 
Thank You,
 
 


Michelle D. Treadwell
Accounting Specialist
Department of Environmental Protection
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https://clicktime.symantec.com/34R6bNKkmvzY6mprft8JgVx7Vc?u=https%3A%2F%2Fnam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%3Furl%3Dhttps%253A%252F%252Ffloridadep.gov%252F%26data%3D02%257C01%257C%257C411e75192c534bf0a69d08d7b15cc7b7%257C8a807b9b02da47f3a903791a42a2285c%257C0%257C1%257C637172884795269474%26sdata%3DSECBCsWOp%252FdSlyAkuO2ASm8IO1ih7PHiPFtE60TSYn4%253D%26reserved%3D0
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Wire Transfers

Remittance [ 1509405 Received Date * [01/1912022 L
Check#* [ WIRE Amount* 2050000

Name * [BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE Il

Addressi |








         


Bureau of Finance and Accounting
Michelle.D.Treadwell@floridadep.gov
Office: 850.245.2367


 


 Please consider the environment before printing this email
 



mailto:Michelle.D.Treadwell@floridadep.gov




Wire Transfers

Remittance [ 1509405 Received Date * [01/1912022 L
Check#* [ WIRE Amount* 2050000

Name * [BRIGHTWORK REAL ESTATE Il

Addressi |





 

 

 

Florida Department Of 
Environmental Protection 

 
Northeast District 

8800 Baymeadows Way West, Suite 100 
Jacksonville, Florida 32256 

Ron DeSantis 
Governor 

 
Jeanette Nuñez 

Lt. Governor 
 

Shawn Hamilton 
Secretary 

 
 
December 17, 2021 
 
Timothy A. Simmons, Manager 
BAYMIT II, LLC 
3708 W. Swann Avenue, Suite 200 
Tampa, Florida 33609 
ASimmons@brightworkre.com 
 
Daniel J. Bergin, MGRM 
DIRT ON DEMAND, LLC 
3802 Ehrlich Rd., Suite 312 
Tampa, Florida 33609 
dbergin@ondemandfl.com 
 
Subject:  FDEP v. Baymit II, LLC & Dirt on Demand, LLC 

OGC File Number 21-1018 
Duval County – Environmental Resource Program, Site ID: 407243 and 
NPDES Stormwater Program, Permit #FLR20EO49 

 
Dear Messrs. Simmons and Bergin: 
 
Enclosed is a copy of the executed Consent Order to resolve Case Number 21-1018. 
 

The effective date of this Order is December 17, 2021, and all time frames will be referenced from this 
date. 
 

As a reminder, a Consent Order is a binding legal document and was voluntarily entered into by both 
parties.   
 

Should you have any questions concerning the Consent Order, please contact Matthew Kershner via 
email at Matthew.Kershner@FloridaDEP.gov, or by phone at (904) 256-1649. Your continued 
cooperation in the matter is appreciated. 
 
Sincerely, 
 

 
 
James R. Maher, PE 
Assistant Director 
 
Enclosure: Executed Consent Order 
 
ec: FDEP-OGC: Lea Crandall, Agency Clerk 
 FDEP-NED: Arlene Wilkinson, Sally Logan, Joni Petry 
 FDEP-Tallahassee: Savanna Harrison 





















12/10/21

17th December

December 17, 2021




















