
1

Tift, Rachel

From: EPOST_SWM
Sent: Tuesday, May 8, 2018 3:56 PM
To: John.Phillip.Arnold@gmail.com
Cc: Tift, Rachel; EPOST_SWM; Financial Assurance Working Group
Subject: WACS Facility ID/ Name: 87895 / ENTERPRISE LF & RECYC (FKA SID LARKIN & SON, INC.)

  Applicant Name: JOHN ARNOLD 
  Applicant Company: ANGELO'S AGGREGATE MATERIALS LTD 
  Permit File Number: 0177982‐027‐SC 
  WACS/ME ID: 87895 
  Application Received Date: 05/08/2018 
  Project Name/Description: ENTERPRISE ROAD CLASS III/Construction Permit Renewal 
 
Dear Applicant:  
 
Thank you for the recent Permit Application regarding the above referenced facility. We value your time and wanted you 
to know that the Department is working on identifying ways to streamline its review process. We would like to reduce 
the number of requests for additional information (RAIs), as well as the overall time we each need to complete the 
review. We appreciate your effort to assist us in providing a timely review by ensuring that the response to any RAI you 
may receive is thorough and complete. We also encourage communication with our permit processor if there are 
questions which may help with any RAI you may receive.  
 
If you did not include a full payment for this application's fees and would like to make an online payment for the 
outstanding balance, please visit the DEP Business Portal ‐ https://www.fldepportal.com ‐ and complete the online 
payment process for a  submitted application. Please note that the following fee types may not be completed through 
this process:  
 
   * Payments for annual fees  
   * Payments processed by a local delegated program  
   * Partial payments for application balances  
 
If you have any questions regarding this Permitting Application, please contact the Permitting Processor ‐ RACHEL TIFT at 
Rachel.Tift@dep.state.fl.us or by phone at 813‐470‐5755.  
 
If you feel you have received this email in error, please contact RACHEL TIFT at Rachel.Tift@dep.state.fl.us  
 
  



1

Tift, Rachel

From: EPOST_SWM
Sent: Tuesday, May 8, 2018 4:00 PM
To: John.Phillip.Arnold@gmail.com
Cc: Tift, Rachel; EPOST_SWM; Financial Assurance Working Group
Subject: WACS Facility ID/ Name: 87895 / ENTERPRISE LF & RECYC (FKA SID LARKIN & SON, INC.)

  Applicant Name: JOHN ARNOLD 
  Applicant Company: ANGELO'S AGGREGATE MATERIALS LTD 
  Permit File Number: 0177982‐028‐SO 
  WACS/ME ID: 87895 
  Application Received Date: 05/08/2018 
  Project Name/Description: ENTERPRISE ROAD CLASS III/Operation Permit Renewal 
 
Dear Applicant:  
 
Thank you for the recent Permit Application regarding the above referenced facility. We value your time and wanted you
to know that the Department is working on identifying ways to streamline its review process. We would like to reduce 
the number of requests for additional information (RAIs), as well as the overall time we each need to complete the 
review. We appreciate your effort to assist us in providing a timely review by ensuring that the response to any RAI you 
may receive is thorough and complete. We also encourage communication with our permit processor if there are 
questions which may help with any RAI you may receive.  
 
If you did not include a full payment for this application's fees and would like to make an online payment for the 
outstanding balance, please visit the DEP Business Portal ‐ https://www.fldepportal.com ‐ and complete the online 
payment process for a  submitted application. Please note that the following fee types may not be completed through 
this process:  
 
   * Payments for annual fees  
   * Payments processed by a local delegated program  
   * Partial payments for application balances  
 
If you have any questions regarding this Permitting Application, please contact the Permitting Processor ‐ RACHEL TIFT at 
Rachel.Tift@dep.state.fl.us or by phone at 813‐470‐5755.  
 
If you feel you have received this email in error, please contact RACHEL TIFT at Rachel.Tift@dep.state.fl.us  
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