
From: Cunningham, Randall
To: Patricia Johns; Eldredge, Susan F
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group
Subject: Global Tire Recycling (WACS 53122) 0136808-007-WT-02
Date: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 1:59:00 PM

Ms. Johns,
 
I have reviewed the document ‘Closure Cost Estimating Form for Solid Waste Facilities’ dated
3/10/20 for the Global Tire Recycling of Sumter County, Inc., received 3/10/20.  Your facility correctly
used the inflation adjustment factor of 1.022 to calculate a closure cost estimate of $85,926.  The
closure cost estimate is approved by the Department.
 
The documentation to demonstrate financial assurance must be sent to Susan Eldredge, FDEP Solid
Waste Section, MS-4548, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399.
 
If you have any questions regarding this email, please give me a call at 407-897-4152.  You may
contact Ms. Eldredge for any questions you have about documentation to demonstrate financial
assurance at 850-245-8740 or Susan.F.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us.
 
Thanks,
Randall Cunningham
DEP Central District
 
 
From: Patricia Johns <pat@gtrcrumbrubber.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 1:53 PM
To: Eldredge, Susan F <Susan.Eldredge@dep.state.fl.us>
Cc: Cunningham, Randall <Randall.Cunningham@FloridaDEP.gov>; Financial Assurance Working
Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>
Subject: Closure Cost Est for 0136808-007-WT-02
 
Attached

--
Patricia Johns
Accounting Manager
Global Tire Recycling
1201 Industrial Drive
Wildwood, FL 34785
352-330-2213  Fax 352-330-2214
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