Wargo, Emily

From: Wargo, Emily

Sent: Wednesday, September 02, 2020 2:59 PM

To: us27tires@gmail.com

Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group; Morgan, Steve; Tafuni, Steven; Madden, Melissa; Newsome,
Kaitlyn

Subject: RE: 2020 Cost Estimate Approval Letter - US 27 Tires (WACS ID: 101295)

Attachments: Annual Cost Estimate 2020.pdf

Dear Mr. Belfakir:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt of inflation-adjusted cost estimates, dated and received September 2, 2020, for
closure of the US 27 Tires Waste Tire Processing Facility. The cost estimates received September 2, 2020 (total for
closing $5,508.68) are APPROVED for 2020. This estimate is for disposal of 5,300 waste tires. The next annual cost
estimate is due at least 60 days prior to anniversary of the financial assurance mechanism. This information may be
found here: https://floridadep.gov/waste/permitting-compliance-assistance/documents/tire-facility-list.

A copy of these estimates is forwarded, via this email, to the Solid Waste Financial Coordinator at
Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us. Financial assurance documents can be sent to: Solid Waste Section,
FDEP, 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2407. Please work with the coordinator directly to
assess the facility's compliance with the funding mechanism requirements of Rule 62-701.630, F.A.C.

Further information about Solid Waste Financial Assurance can be found at the Department's website at:
https://floridadep.gov/waste/permitting-compliance-assistance/content/solid-waste-financial-assurance

Thank you,

Emily Wargo

Engineering Specialist 11

Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District
Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov

Office: 813-470-5942

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Electronic communications regarding state business are public records
available upon request. Your e-mail communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Al Bell <us27tires@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 02, 2020 10:03 AM

To: Newsome, Kaitlyn <Kaitlyn.Newsome@FloridaDEP.gov>; SWD_Waste <SWD_Waste@dep.state.fl.us>; Financial
Assurance Working Group <Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@dep.state.fl.us>; Wargo, Emily
<Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov>

Subject: Re: 2020 Cost Estimate Inquiry for US 27 Tires (WACS ID: 101295)

Please see attachment.



Thank you
US 27 Tires, LLC

On Wed, Sep 2, 2020 at 8:34 AM Newsome, Kaitlyn <Kaitlyn.Newsome@floridadep.gov> wrote:

Good Morning,

I am currently conducting a file review for US 27 Tires (WACS ID: 101295). Upon review, it appears that the
2020 Cost Estimate due on September 1, 2020 have not yet been received by the Department. Can you please
advise as to the status of this submittal?

2. Annual Cost Estimates. The permittee shall annually adjust the closing cost estimate in
accordance with Rule 62-711.500(3), F.A.C. The owner or operator shall submit the annual
cost estimate at least 60 davs prior to the anniversary date of their financial assurance
mechanism.

All submittals in response to this specific condition shall be sent to the Southwest District
Office Compliance Assurance Program at SWD_Waste(@ FloridaDEP.gov and a copy to the
address identified in Specific Condition F.1. or to the following email address:
Solid. Waste Financial Coordinatorf@ FlondaDEP. gov.

Thank you,

Kate Newsome
Kate Newsome

Environmental Specialist 11
Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District

13051 North Telecom Parkway, Suite 101

Temple Terrace, FL 33637

Office: 813-470-5877

Fax: 813-470-5995

Kaitlyn.Newsome@FloridaDEP.gov




Please Note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials regarding state
business are public records available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail communications may therefore be subject to
public disclosure.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
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September 2, 2020

Florida Department of Environmental Protection
Southwest District Office

13051 N. Telecom Parkway

Temple Terrace, FL 33637

Re: US 27 Tires, LLC (WACS # 101295)
Financial Assurance Cost Estimate

To Whom It May Concern,

There has been no change in the above referenced facility concerning waste tires storage, and the
facility is operating in compliance with the permit requirements. The maximum number of tires that
can be stored onsite is 5300 tires. The anticipated disposal cost for the maximum storage quantity is
calculated as follows:

2019 Disposal Cost Estimate = $5416.60
FDEP Inflation Multiplier 2020 = 1.017

2020 Disposal Cost Estimate $5416.60 x 1.017 = $5508.68
Current Bond Balance: $5579.08, Citizens Bank Trust Fund No. | IIIEEE

If you have any questions, please call me at 407-590-9487 or email ua27tiresidigmail eom

Vi befhle..

Abdel Belfakir
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