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Rhodes, Shayla J

From: Rhodes, Shayla J
Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 3:24 PM
To: us27tires@gmail.com
Cc: Financial Assurance Working Group; Madden, Melissa; Wargo, Emily; SWD_Waste@floridadep.gov
Subject: 2022 Cost Estimate Approval Letter - US 27 Tires (WACS ID# 101295)
Attachments: 101295.2023 Cost estimate letter.pdf

Dear Mr. Belfakir: 
 
This letter is to acknowledge receipt of inflation‐adjusted cost estimates, dated January 25, 2023 and received January 
27, 2023, for closure of the US 27 Tires Waste Processing Facility. The cost estimates received January 25, 2023 (total for 
closing $5,803.34) are APPROVED for 2022.  This estimate is for disposal of 5,300 waste tires. The next annual update 
(revised estimates) is due no later than October 26, 2023 with the facility’s permit renewal application.  
  
A copy of these estimates is forwarded, via this email, to the Solid Waste Financial Coordinator at 
Financial.Assurance.Working.Group@FloridaDEP.gov. Financial assurance documents can be sent to: Solid Waste 
Section, FDEP, 2600 Blair Stone Road MS 4548, Tallahassee, Florida 32399‐2407. Please work with the coordinator 
directly to assess the facility's compliance with the funding mechanism requirements of Rule 62‐701.630, F.A.C.  
 
Further information about Solid Waste Financial Assurance can be found at the Department's website at:  
https://floridadep.gov/waste/permitting‐compliance‐assistance/content/solid‐waste‐financial‐assurance  
  
*Please Note: The submitted cost estimate letter contains a typo regarding the calculation, however the final inflation‐
adjusted closure cost estimate amount is correct.  
 
Thank you, 
 
 

 

Shayla Rhodes 
Florida Department of Environmental Protection 
Southwest District 
Engineering Specialist  
Shayla.J.Rhodes@FloridaDEP.gov 
Office: 813-470-5704 

 

From: Abdel Bell <us27tires@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2023 10:45 AM 
To: Roach, Joshua <Joshua.Roach@FloridaDEP.gov>; Wargo, Emily <Emily.Wargo@FloridaDEP.gov> 
Subject: Updated: Inflation‐Adjusted Cost Estimates US 27 Tires (WACS ID: 101259) 
 

EXTERNAL MESSAGE 
This email originated outside of DEP. Please use caution when opening attachments, clicking links, or responding to this 

email. 

Hi, 
Please disregard the email sent yesterday. This is the updated financial assurance. 
Thank you 
 
 
‐‐  
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US 27 Tires, LLC 
29612 Highway 27 
Dundee, FL 33838 
863‐248‐2911 
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